
 
 
 

MediaCorp Pte Ltd 

Daily Programme Listing 
 

okto  THURSDAY 1 MAY 2014 
 
 
9.00AM           LABOUR DAY 2014: Dora The Explorer Special: Dora‘s World Adventure (Preschool) 

(幼儿乐园) 

Dora and her friends are ready to celebrate friendship day when they realize all of 
the friendship bracelets are missing. Swiper has swiped them from all of the 
friendship parades around the world, and the bracelets won't "glow" unless 
everyone around the world has them. 

 

10.00  LABOUR DAY 2014: The Fox & The Hound 2 (Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

When the Fair arrives, those unlikely friends TOD, a fox cub and COPPER, a happy 
hound puppy are mesmerized by The Singing Strays, a harmonizing dog act. When 
the Strays hear Copper's singing, they invite him to join their group. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 17 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Peppa Pig (Srs 3 & 4 / Eps 45 - 48 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

  Peppa is a loveable, cheeky little piggy who lives with her little brother George, Mummy 
Pig and Daddy Pig! Peppa's favourite things include playing games, dressing up, days out 
and jumping in muddy puddles. Her adventures always end happily. 

 

12.30PM         Octonauts (Season 1 / Ep 21 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The Octonauts are a crew of eight adorable animals who explore the ocean in search of 
adventure and fun! From their undersea "Octopod" base, the eight talented critters are 
always ready to embark on new exciting missions. 
 

1.00  Dive Olly Dive (Sr 2 / Eps 47 - 48 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Join Olly and his friend and sub-in-training Beth and explore their spectacular underwater 
world. There is never a dull moment in Olly's world! 

 

1.30  Between The Lions (Sr 3 / Ep 8 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

2.00  Franklin & Friends (Season 2 / Ep 22 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

New episodes of Franklin the turtle and his friends. 

 
 
 
 



2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 17 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
 

3.00  oktOriginal: Dream School (Eps 1 - 2 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 

A group of kids enrol into a school for the performing arts. This musical drama series is 
about their trials and tribulations as they try to fit into a creative environment to nurture 
their special gifts.  

 
 

 
 
okto  THURSDAY 1 MAY 2014 
 

4.00PM oktOriginal: Saved Or Slimed (Sr 2 / Eps 1 - 2 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

This season of the zany children’s game show, it is fun-filled, educational and definitely 

wet! The game show challenges the Mental, Physical & Social aspects of the participants.  
Each week sees three schools racing to save their school mate.  

 
5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 11 - 12 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 

5.30  Transformers Rescue Bots (Season 1 / Ep 19 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Meet the Rescue Bots! Chase, Heatwave, Blades and Boulder ate given a very important 
mission by Optimus Prime: protect and learn about mankind. Stationed undercover on a 
technologically advanced island, they team up with a family of 1st responders. With help f 
Cody, they keep peace and people safe. 

 

6.00  Planet Sheen (Season 1 / Ep 5 / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片) 

After sneaking into his best friend Jimmy Neutron's laboratory, Sheen accidentally blasts 
himself into outer space in Jimmy's top-secret rocketship! Sheen crash-lands on Planet 
Zeenu and ends up having crazy adventures with the Zeenuians while trying to survive the 
evil plots of Dorkus. 

 

6.30       Johnny Test (Sr 6 / Ep 6 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

New season of Johnny Test and his dog Dukey wacky adventures! 
 
7.00  Scooby-Doo! Mystery Incorporated (Season 1 / Ep 1 / Debut / Schoolkids / Cartoon)  

(卡通片) 

A sleepy little village, Crystal Cove boasts a long history of ghost sightings, 
poltergeists, demon possessions, phantoms and other paranormal occurrences. 
The renowned sleuthing team of Fred, Daphne, Velma, Shaggy and Scooby-Doo 
prove all of this simply isn't real, and along the way, uncover a larger, season-long 
mystery that will change everything. 
 

 



7.30  Dude, That‘s My Ghost! (Eps 31 – 32 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Dude, That’s My Ghost! follows the adventures of 14-year-old Spencer when he moves to 
Hollywood with  his family and has to adjust to life with his new buddy, the ghost of uber-
famous pop star, Billy Joe Cobra.  
 

8.00  oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 4 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

The Head Prefect is out for revenge. She abuses her power and makes the Primary 3 
prefects do errands for her. Justin takes matters into his own hands and kidnaps the Head 
Prefect to teach her a lesson.   

 
 
 

8.30  oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 4 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

Nikki throws and kicks different types of balls at objects inside the house. Aiken finds out 
just how dangerous killer litter can be. Mr Know It All learns the hard way that leaving toys 
on the floor can be painful. 
  

 

okto THURSDAY 1 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM           DOCUMENTARY: Wild Case Files: Blood Red Rain (Ep 4 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Dozens of dogs are jumping off a bridge in Scotland to their deaths; one endangered 
manatee after another is found floating dead in the coastal waters of Southwest Florida; 
and heavy downpours of red-coloured rain falls on Kerala, India. 

 
10.00  a-ok: Island Feast With Peter Kuruvita (Ep 5 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

This series takes Australian chef Peter Kuruvita into some of the world’s most fascinating 
island communities, where he discovers the vibrant intricacies of island life and the 
tradition, passion and flair behind local cuisines. 
 

10.30  a-ok: Luke Nguyen’s Greater Mekong Part 1 (Ep 5 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

Luke Nguyen discovers the little known foods and flavours of Yangon – the former capital 
city of Myanmar. He cooks Mohinga (rice noodles in fish soup), Myanmar Vegetarian 
Wraps, and King Prawn Tomato Curry. 
 

11.00   a-ok: The Private Lives Of Medieval Kings (Ep 2 / Info-ed) (益智节目)    

Dr Janina Ramirez unlocks the secrets of medieval illuminated manuscripts and shows 
how they gave power to the king and united the kingdom in an age of plague, warfare and 
rebellion.  
 

12.00MN         Close 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 



MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
Daily Programme Listing 
 

okto  FRIDAY 2 MAY 2014 
 
9.00AM          Maya The Bee (Eps 37 – 38 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

A young bee named Maya has left her hive to discover the beauty and mysteries of nature. 
As she explores the meadow where she lives, she meets other insects living there, plays 
to her heart's content and shares her joy with her friends. Constantly amazed by her 
discoveries, Maya's enthusiasm is contagious! 

 

9.30   Postman Pat SDS 2 (Eps 9 - 10 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The continuing adventures of everyone's favorite Postman Pat and his beloved cat Jess! 
 

10.00   Dive Olly Dive (Sr 2 / Eps 49 - 50 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Join Olly and his friend and sub-in-training Beth and explore their spectacular underwater 
world. There is never a dull moment in Olly's world! 

 

10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 3 / Ep 9 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

11.00  Franklin & Friends (Season 2 / Ep 23 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

New episodes of Franklin the turtle and his friends. 
 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 18 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Peppa Pig (Srs 3 & 4 / Eps 49 - 52 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
  Peppa is a loveable, cheeky little piggy who lives with her little brother George, Mummy Pig and 

Daddy Pig! Peppa's favourite things include playing games, dressing up, days out and jumping in 
muddy puddles. Her adventures always end happily. 

 

12.30PM         Octonauts (Season 1 / Ep 22 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The Octonauts are a crew of eight adorable animals who explore the ocean in search of 
adventure and fun! From their undersea "Octopod" base, the eight talented critters are 
always ready to embark on new exciting missions. 

 

1.00  Dive Olly Dive (Sr 2 / Eps 49 - 50 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Join Olly and his friend and sub-in-training Beth and explore their spectacular underwater 
world. There is never a dull moment in Olly's world! 

 

1.30  Between The Lions (Sr 3 / Ep 9 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

2.00  Franklin & Friends (Season 2 / Ep 23 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

New episodes of Franklin the turtle and his friends. 
 



   
 
 
 

okto  FRIDAY 2 MAY 2014 
 
2.30PM William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 18 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Nick Of Time (Eps 1 - 2 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 

A fun adventure drama series, Nick of Time is about improving our way of life, conserving 
nature and how we all have a part to play to make a better future for everyone. 

 
4.00  oktOriginal: Little Great Givers (Eps 1 - 2 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

“Little Great Givers” reveals another face of young Singaporeans - socially conscious and 
responsible individuals who go beyond their means to help others. 

 
 
 

5.00 oktOriginal: The Badge (Ep 5 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

“The Badge” is a science show that combines passion and compassion.  Each episode will 
feature a team of young inventors, also known as ‘Scientific Social Workers’, working to 
conceptualize and build a Great Invention to solve the real-life problems of different 
profiles.  

 

5.30  Super Yoyo (Ep 5 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Shunichi Domoto is a talented sportie 5th grade boy who used to help sport teams in his 
school. He enters a Yoyo duel against a bully boy called Benkei to help his friend, Beso, to 
get back his Yoyo and won the yoyo battle. However, he meets the exceptionally gifted 
Yoyo-er, Seito Hojoin who beat him because he ridiculed Yoyo game .So, Shunichi enters 
the Japan`s Yoyo championship to get his revenge with Seito.  

 

6.00  oktOriginal: KNOCKOUT (Sr 7 / Ep 5 / Local Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

This week, it’s short story writing, awesome school events, pre-performance rituals and a 
twirlin’ good time under my umbrella. Then, it’s time to crunk for the Krumping challenge. 
Let is all out, only on KNOCKOUT: CARNIVAL! 

 

6.30      Johnny Test (Sr 6 / Ep 7 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

New season of Johnny Test and his dog Dukey wacky adventures! 
 

7.00  Ooglies (Ep 6 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

A quirky and wacky series of shorts featuring vegetables and household objects brought to 
stop-motion, animated life! 

  

7.15   Great Eastern YEO’s S.League 2014: Warriors FC VS Home United FC (Sports / LIVE)  

 
 
 
 



okto  FRIDAY 2 MAY 2014 
 
9.30PM          ANIMAL NIGHT: Nature’s Microworlds (Ep 10 / Info-ed) (With Chinese Subtitles)  

(益智节目)  

Nature’s Microworlds takes viewers on a fascinating journey, offering a definitive guide to 
some very special places on Earth. 

 

10.00 a-ok: Sherlock (Sr 2 / Ep 1 / Drama) (电视剧) (PG 13 – Mature Theme) 

A case of blackmail threatens to topple the monarchy itself, but soon Sherlock and John 
discover there is even more to it than that. They find themselves battling international 
terrorism, rogue CIA agents, and a secret conspiracy involving the British government. 

 
12.00MN        Close 
 

 

 
MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
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okto  SATURDAY 3 MAY 2014 
 

 
 

7.00AM           oktOriginal: Zoom, Zim, Zam (Eps 9 - 10 / Local Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

“Zoom Zim Zam” is a, phonics based educational pre-school series.  The series features 
Zoomba, Zimba and Zamba literacy superheroes. Who together with their friends learn 
about the world around them and the sounds that alphabets make. The series will feature 
original songs and Dance as part of the programme. 
 

8.00           oktOriginal: Ollie & Friends (Sr 2 / Eps 9 - 10 / Local Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Ollie and Friends Sr 2 is a preschool kids program following the adventures of Ollie. He 
travels through different levels of oktopolis with Tommy and Jenny as they learn new 
things along the way. Ollie’s friends Cherry, Rover, Sloppy, Max, Jax and Vicky also join in 
the fun!   
 

9.00  My Little Pony: Friendship Is Magic (Season 2 / Ep 13 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片)  

More magical adventures in Equestria and Ponyville, with Twilight Sparkle and her best 
pony gal friends not forgetting Spike, of course! 
 

9.30  The Tom & Jerry Show (Ep 1 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

The worlds favorite cat and mouse return for more madcap adventures! 
 
10.00  Pokemon: BW Adventures In Unova And Beyond (Sr 16 / Ep 18 / Schoolkids / Cartoon)  

(卡通片)  

Arriving in Virbank City, our heroes and N encounter another group of heroes with some 
surprising results! 
 

 
 



10.30  Planet Sheen (Season 1 / Ep 6 / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片) 

After sneaking into his best friend Jimmy Neutron's laboratory, Sheen accidentally blasts 
himself into outer space in Jimmy's top-secret rocketship! Sheen crash-lands on Planet 
Zeenu and ends up having crazy adventures with the Zeenuians while trying to survive the 
evil plots of Dorkus. 

 

11.00  Little Battlers eXperience (Sr 2 / Ep 19 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

This is the story about two main heroes who love LBX and defend the world from tyranny 
with nothing but their LBX! 
 

11.30  Power Rangers Mega Force (Ep 6 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Five teenagers with talent and attitude to form the ultimate team...the Power Rangers 
Megaforce! Using their new found special abilities, mega-weapons, high-tech Zords and 
giant Megazords to battle this new alien threat. 
 

12.00NN oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 5 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids) (益智节目)   

The Head Prefect is out for revenge. She abuses her power and makes the Primary 3 
prefects do errands for her. Justin takes matters into his own hands and kidnaps the Head 
Prefect to teach her a lesson. 
 

 
 

okto  SATURDAY 3 MAY 2014 
 

12.30PM       oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 5 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids) (益智节目)   

Nikki throws and kicks different types of balls at objects inside the house. Aiken finds out 
just how dangerous killer litter can be. Mr Know It All learns the hard way that leaving toys 
on the floor can be painful.  

  
1.00  Adventurers Masters Of Time (Eps 9 - 10 / Schoolkids / R)  

Four schoolfriends are suddenly whisked back through the ages on a desperate search for 
their missing computer professor - by uploading themselves by way of a time continuum 
software! Unfortunately they haven't made the journey alone. An evil hacker is threatening 
to change world history. 

 
2.00  Kaijudo (Eps 7 - 8 / Schoolkids / R)  

Ray, a 14-year-old who lives with his mom and granddad, has been recruited by the Duel 
Masters to study Kaijudo: The Way of the Creature. They chose Ray for his natural talent 
as a creature tamer and duelist. 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: GX5 (Eps 7 - 8 / Local Drama / R) (电视剧)  

In this action-adventure series, 5 Kids/Teens comes across an email invite to a brand new 
online game called Game Xtreme, and unwittingly find themselves – trapped in it!  As they 
try to find ways and means to get out from their predicament, they realise that there’s a 
strong opposing force who’s trying to keep them in it and he’s none other than the Evil 
villain – SPAM! 

 
4.00 oktOriginal: The Mad Science Manual (Eps 7 - 8 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R)  

(益智节目) 
Science is mad…fun! Or at least it is when you know how. A series of sixteen episodes that inspire 
home made scientific experiments that send the imagination racing, all the while encouraging kids - 

and the occasional adult - to ask 'WHY?'  



 
5.00 Edebits (Eps 19 – 20 / Schoolkids / Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

  Edebits is the ecological series of the moment! Guided by Bet and her inseparable friends, 
the edebits, boys and girls will learn and discover about issues such as environmental 
awareness or climate change.  

   

5.30 Wendy (Ep 2 / Cartoon / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 

The show charts the adventures of teenage heroine, Wendy and focuses on her equestrian 
centered life. Living on a stud-farm, complete with a riding school and stables, Wendy has 
become an accomplished rider and show jumper; her life is full of gossip, friendships and 
romances. 

   

6.00  Martha Speaks Part 2 (Ep 11 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

New episodes about Martha, a beloved family dog who is accidentally fed alphabet soup, 
giving her the power of speech and the chance to speak her mind to anyone to anyone 
that will listen, often with hilarious consequences!  

 

6.30  Oscar’s Oasis (Ep 17 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Hilarious 3D animated, non-dialogue series in the style of Looney Tunes. Oscar, the lonely 
desert lizard, battles the rigeurs of the desert as well as his un-neighbourly fellow 
inhabitants, from chickens to mischievous meerkats. 

 
 
 

okto  SATURDAY 3 MAY 2014 
 

 

7.00PM     Pokemon: Black & White (Season 15 / Ep 25 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

The continuing adventures of Ash Ketchum and Pikachu as they continue traveling though 
Unova with friends Cilan and Iris, to take on his remaining five gym badges. 

 

7.30  ThunderCats (Ep 9 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

THUNDERCATS presents the grand origin story of Prince Lion-O's ascension to the 
throne and those who would thwart his destiny at any cost and takes on epic dimensions 
in this sharp new telling. 
 

8.00  Mudpit (Ep 18 / Schoolkids / R)  
You ready to ROCK?! You ready to LAUGH?! Then you're ready for... MUDPIT! A live-
action/animated comedy series about four teens that form a virtual rock band in hopes of 
becoming real rock stars! 

 

8.30  Fort Boyard Ultimate Challenge (Srs 1 & 2 / Ep 2 / Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Fort Boyard - Ultimate Challenge is the ultimate adventure series where 24 teens from the 
United States and the United Kingdom compete as teams in a series of exciting 
challenges designed to test their brainpower, courage and teamwork! 
 
 
 

 
 
 



okto  SATURDAY 3 MAY 2014 

 

9.00PM oktoLIFE: Big Sur: California’s Wild Coast (Info-ed) (益智节目)  

It has been called the greatest meeting of land and sea in the world. The Santa Lucia 
Mountains rise precipitously from the Pacific Ocean just south of Monterey on the central 
Californian coast. A sometimes violent, yet fragile place, Big Sur challenges the senses.  

 
10.00  CENTRESTAGE: Swan Lake: Mariinsky Live (Culture)  

Tchaikovsky’s classic three-act ballet, performed by Mariinsky Ballet, features Ekaterina 
Kondaurova, Timur Askerov and Andrei Yermakov. It was recorded in the imperial 
splendor of the Mariinsky Theatre, St Petersburg. 

 
12.20AM       Close 
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okto SUNDAY 4 MAY 2014 
 

 

7.00AM           oktOriginal: Club M.A.G.I.C (Eps 9 – 10 / Local Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

CLUB M.A.G.I.C was developed to enrich the learning experience of preschoolers by 
creating a purposeful teaching environment that nurtures their holistic development. The 
series celebrates the joy of learning while encouraging children to adopt a positive, can-do 
attitude whenever they embark on a task.  

 

8.00           LazyTown (Season 1 / Eps 28 – 29 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
In LazyTown, Stephanie and Sportacus are always trying to helps the kids to live active lifestyles, 
while thwarting the schemes of the world’s laziest super-villain, Robbie Rotten! A funny, fresh show. 

 

9.00 Stuart Little: The Animated Series (Ep 3 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Everyones favorite Little guy returns in this fun-filled animated adventure series.  Whether 
he’s exploring the great outdoors, skate boarding with his brother George or in pursuit of 
Taco Tuesday, Stuart Little brings his trademark heart and humor sure to delight the whole 
family. 
 

9.30 The Adventures Of Tintin (Ep 29 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) (PG) 

The original TinTin animated series featuring the classic adventures of the globetrotting 
young journalist, TinTin, and his dog, Snowy. 
 

10.00  Buddy Fight (Ep 14 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Trading card based Japanese anime series. Children form a contract with creatures, also 
known as their buddy, and fight as a tag team combination. 

 

10.30  Cardfight Vanguard (Sr 3 / Ep 30 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Exciting 3rd season of Cardfight Vanguard. 
 
 



11.00  Little Battlers eXperience (Sr 2 / Ep 20 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

This is the story about two main heroes who love LBX and defend the world from tyranny 
with nothing but their LBX! 

 

11.30  Jackie Chan Adventures (Season 3 / Ep 12 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Jackie Chan teams up in this anime-style animated adventure with his 11-year-old niece, 
Jade, traveling the globe to locate a dozen magical talismans before the sinister Dark 
Hand does. 

 
12.00NN Robotboy (Season 2 / Eps 9 - 10 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Created by world-renowned scientist Professor Moshimo, Robotboy attracts the diabolical 
attention of supervillains intent on harnessing Robotboy's powers to enslave the world. So 
Moshimo sends Robotboy far away to live with his number one fan, Tommy. 

 
12.30PM Geronimo Stilton (Ep 5 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Geronimo Stilton is an exciting animated adventure-comedy series that follows the adventures of 
the famous - Geronimo Stilton – erudite mouse, head of a veritable media empire and klutz 
extraordinaire and Benjamin Stilton his fearless and smart 12 year old nephew.   

 

1.00  Arthur (Sr 8 / Ep 10 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Arther and Friends return! 

 
okto SUNDAY 4 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM The Adventures Of Paddington Bear (Ep 17 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Follow the adventures of the well-loved classic bear. 
 

2.00 Dirt Girl World (Eps 19 - 20 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Uniquely animated series with an environmental focus, e.g. exploring recycling and 
growing your own vegetables. 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: My Classmate Dad (Eps 9 – 10 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 
My Classmate Dad is a lighthearted drama series about what happens when a 38-year-old father 
gets trapped in the body of his 12-year-old nephew who’s also the classmate of his son.  

 

4.00  oktOriginal: Word Champs (Eps 9 – 10 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Word Champs challenges 3 kids to solve fun word games to receive points, gifts & get 
messy for the chance to win an exciting grand prize. 

 

5.00 Oscar The Balloonist (Eps 11 – 12 / Cartoon / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片)  

Join the exiting adventures of eight-year-old Oscar, who travels the world in his hot air 
balloon together with his trusted companion, Spike the Cactus!  
 

5.30 Wendy (Ep 3 / Cartoon / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 
The show charts the adventures of teenage heroine, Wendy and focuses on her equestrian 
centered life. Living on a stud-farm, complete with a riding school and stables, Wendy has become 
an accomplished rider and show jumper; her life is full of gossip, friendships and romances. 

 

6.00  Martha Speaks Part 2 (Ep 14 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

New episodes about Martha, a beloved family dog who is accidentally fed alphabet soup, 
giving her the power of speech and the chance to speak her mind to anyone to anyone 
that will listen, often with hilarious consequences!  



 

6.30 Oscar’s Oasis (Ep 18 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Hilarious 3D animated, non-dialogue series in the style of Looney Tunes. Oscar, the lonely 
desert lizard, battles the rigeurs of the desert as well as his un-neighbourly fellow 
inhabitants, from chickens to mischievous meerkats. 

 

7.00      Pokemon: Black & White (Season 15 / Ep 26 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

The continuing adventures of Ash Ketchum and Pikachu as they continue traveling though 
Unova with friends Cilan and Iris, to take on his remaining five gym badges. 

 

7.30  ThunderCats (Ep 10 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

THUNDERCATS presents the grand origin story of Prince Lion-O's ascension to the 
throne and those who would thwart his destiny at any cost and takes on epic dimensions 
in this sharp new telling. 

 
8.00  Mudpit (Ep 19 / Schoolkids / R)  

You ready to ROCK?! You ready to LAUGH?! Then you're ready for... MUDPIT! A live-
action/animated comedy series about four teens that form a virtual rock band in hopes of 
becoming real rock stars! 
 

8.30  The S.League Show (Ep 10 / Local Sports)  
All the goals and best action from another week of the S.League rolled into one show. The 
best football clubs in Singapore battle it out to be crowned S.League champions at the end 
of the season. 

 
 

okto SUNDAY 4 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM          Doctor Who (Sr 7 / Ep 7 / Drama) (电视剧)  

Matt Smith returns for this series as the Eleventh Doctor. Each new epic adventure 
featuring new monsters and some familiar foes as you’ve never seen them before.  
 

10.00  FILMART: Glory (Movie) (艺 术 影 院) 

The saga of the first black fighting unit in America's civil war is an inspiring testament to 
courage, the human spirit, and the value of freedom.  Starring Academy Denzel 
Washington and Morgan Freeman 

 
12.00MN         Close  
 
 
 
  

 
 
 
 
 
 



MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
Daily Programme Listing 
 

okto MONDAY 5 MAY 2014 
 

9.00AM           Maya The Bee (Eps 39 - 40 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
A young bee named Maya has left her hive to discover the beauty and mysteries of nature. As she 
explores the meadow where she lives, she meets other insects living there, plays to her heart's 
content and shares her joy with her friends. Constantly amazed by her discoveries, Maya's 
enthusiasm is contagious! 

 

9.30   Postman Pat SDS 2 (Eps 11 - 12 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The continuing adventures of everyone's favorite Postman Pat and his beloved cat Jess! 
 

10.00   Dive Olly Dive (Sr 2 / Eps 51 - 52 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Join Olly and his friend and sub-in-training Beth and explore their spectacular underwater 
world. There is never a dull moment in Olly's world! 

 

10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 3 / Ep 10 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

11.00  Franklin & Friends (Season 2 / Ep 24 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

New episodes of Franklin the turtle and his friends. 
 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 19 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 12 / Eps 1 - 2 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons.  

 

 

12.30PM         Octonauts (Season 1 / Ep 23 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The Octonauts are a crew of eight adorable animals who explore the ocean in search of 
adventure and fun! From their undersea "Octopod" base, the eight talented critters are 
always ready to embark on new exciting missions. 

 

1.00  Dive Olly Dive (Sr 2 / Eps 51 - 52 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Join Olly and his friend and sub-in-training Beth and explore their spectacular underwater 
world. There is never a dull moment in Olly's world! 

 

1.30  Between The Lions (Sr 3 / Ep 10 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

 



2.00  Franklin & Friends (Season 2 / Ep 24 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

New episodes of Franklin the turtle and his friends. 
 
 
 
 

okto MONDAY 5 MAY 2014 
 

2.30PM William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 19 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: GX5 (Eps 9 – 10 / Local Drama / R) (电视剧) 

In this action-adventure series, 5 Kids/Teens comes across an email invite to a brand new 
online game called Game Xtreme, and unwittingly find themselves – trapped in it!  As they 
try to find ways and means to get out from their predicament, they realise that there’s a 
strong opposing force who’s trying to keep them in it and he’s none other than the Evil 
villain – SPAM! 

 
4.00  oktOriginal: The Mad Science Manual (Eps 9 - 10 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R)  

(益智节目) 
Science is mad…fun! Or at least it is when you know how. A series of sixteen episodes that inspire 
home made scientific experiments that send the imagination racing, all the while encouraging kids - 

and the occasional adult - to ask 'WHY?'  
 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 13 - 14 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 

5.30  Transformers Rescue Bots (Season 1 / Ep 20 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Meet the Rescue Bots! Chase, Heatwave, Blades and Boulder ate given a very important 
mission by Optimus Prime: protect and learn about mankind. Stationed undercover on a 
technologically advanced island, they team up with a family of 1st responders. With help f 
Cody, they keep peace and people safe. 

 
 
 

6.00  oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 5 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

The Head Prefect is out for revenge. She abuses her power and makes the Primary 3 
prefects do errands for her. Justin takes matters into his own hands and kidnaps the Head 
Prefect to teach her a lesson. 

  
6.30     okto @ The Movies: Leroy & Stitch (Movie / Schoolkids)  

As a reward for rounding up all 625 experiments, Lilo, Stitch,Jumba, and Pleakley 
have been placed around the galaxy in a spot where each of them thinks they truly 
belong.Their lives are all shook up when the dastardly Dr. Hamsterviel breaks out of 
prison and forces Jumba to create a new experiment! 
  

 



8.30 Tricky TV (Sr 3 / Ep 17 / Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

In this season, host & magician Stephen Mulhern returns with a talented cast of young 
trickers to boogle the brains of the viewing public with amazing magic and stunts. 
 

 
 

 
 
okto MONDAY 5 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM           ANIMAL NIGHT: Wild Kingdom (Ep 3 / Info-ed) (With Chinese Subtitles) (益智节目)  

Summer is boom time for animals in Britain. More sun means more food, but animals are 
arriving from afar to share, and competition is high. Hunters time their arrival from Africa to 
feast on the huge glut of flying insects, thermal cameras reveal nightjars on a Dorset 
heath, and thunderstorms bring out hordes of hungry snails. 
 

10.00  a-ok: Antiques Road Trip (Sr 7 / Ep 4 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Antiques experts Charles Hanson and Christina Trevanion start their journey in Leeds, 
West Yorkshire, and then head through Shipley and Skipton on their way to an auction in 
Penrith, Cumbria. The antiques they buy in this episode include a curious lamp, a 
bookcase, a dressing table, and vintage fashion plates. 

 

11.00   a-ok: Arts.21 (Ep 140 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Features Germany’s up and coming music and dance stars, graphic novels that take us 
back in time, and courageous film-makers from Syria. 

 

11.30   a-ok: Euromaxx (Ep 140 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

Highlight’s an amazing Napoleon impersonator, and a brilliant photographer who uses the 
most unusual models in her work. 

 
12.00MN         Close 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
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okto TUESDAY 6 MAY 2014 
 

 

9.00AM           Maya The Bee (Eps 41 - 42 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

A young bee named Maya has left her hive to discover the beauty and mysteries of nature. 
As she explores the meadow where she lives, she meets other insects living there, plays 
to her heart's content and shares her joy with her friends. Constantly amazed by her 
discoveries, Maya's enthusiasm is contagious! 

 

9.30   Postman Pat SDS 2 (Eps 13 - 14 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The continuing adventures of everyone's favorite Postman Pat and his beloved cat Jess! 
 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 1 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every episode, 
our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a mission with a 
specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic ROCKET, and together 
they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 

10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 4 / Ep 1 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

11.00  Franklin & Friends (Season 2 / Ep 25 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

New episodes of Franklin the turtle and his friends. 
 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 20 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 12 / Eps 3 - 4 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an enhanced 
look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the adventures of a 
cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life lessons. 

 

12.30PM         Octonauts (Season 1 / Ep 24 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The Octonauts are a crew of eight adorable animals who explore the ocean in search of 
adventure and fun! From their undersea "Octopod" base, the eight talented critters are 
always ready to embark on new exciting missions. 

 

1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 1 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every episode, 
our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a mission with a 
specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic ROCKET, and together 
they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
 
 
 



1.30  Between The Lions (Sr 4 / Ep 1 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 
2.00  Franklin & Friends (Season 2 / Ep 25 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

New episodes of Franklin the turtle and his friends. 

 
okto TUESDAY 6 MAY 2014 
 

2.30PM William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 20 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
3.00 oktOriginal: oktOriginal: My Classmate Dad (Sr 2 / Eps 1 – 2 / Local Drama / Schoolkids 

/ R) (电视剧) 
This season brings about a body switch adventure with a whole new twist!  Uncle Adyson and 
nephew Chee Meng are still stuck in each other’s body as a result of a literally electrifying and 
mysterious pendant, and the hunt continues for an end to their unfortunate plight. 
 

4.00  oktOriginal: Word Champs (Eps 11 – 12 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Word Champs challenges 3 kids to solve fun word games to receive points, gifts & get 
messy for the chance to win an exciting grand prize. 

 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 15 - 16 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 

5.30  Transformers Rescue Bots (Season 1 / Ep 21 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
Meet the Rescue Bots! Chase, Heatwave, Blades and Boulder ate given a very important mission 
by Optimus Prime: protect and learn about mankind. Stationed undercover on a technologically 
advanced island, they team up with a family of 1st responders. With help f Cody, they keep peace 
and people safe. 

 

6.00 oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 5 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)  

Nikki throws and kicks different types of balls at objects inside the house. Aiken finds out 
just how dangerous killer litter can be. Mr Know It All learns the hard way that leaving toys 
on the floor can be painful. 
 

6.30            SpongeBob SquarePants (Ep 134 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  
For the world's favourite sea sponge, SpongeBob, his best friend Patrick, and the other residents of 
the tropical Bikini Bottom, life is a series of nautical and often nonsensical adventures.  

 

7.00  Scooby-Doo! Mystery Incorporated (Season 1 / Ep 2 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
A sleepy little village, Crystal Cove boasts a long history of ghost sightings, poltergeists, demon 
possessions, phantoms and other paranormal occurrences. The renowned sleuthing team of Fred, 
Daphne, Velma, Shaggy and Scooby-Doo prove all of this simply isn't real, and along the way, 
uncover a larger, season-long mystery that will change everything. 

 
 
 



7.30  Totally Spies (Sr 6 / Ep 11 / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 
The girls are back to fight more crime for WHOOP! Follow their ongoing journey in the exciting and 
dangerous world of international espionage, all whilst juggling school and their studies! 

 
8.00  Just Kidding (Ep 22 / Schoolkids) 

Just Kidding is a prank show hosted by Zach Fox. 
 

8.30  Lab Rats Challenge (Sr 2 / Ep 4 / Schoolkids / Info-ed) (益智节目)  
In every show two teams made up of pairs of friends compete in a range of science based 
challenges. Each team is assigned a host who commentate on what is happening and how it works. 
They talk to team members about their tactics, progress and feelings.  

 

 
 
 

okto TUESDAY 6 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM          DOCUMENTARY: Food Factory 3 (Eps 9 - 10 / Info-ed) (益智节目) 

From raw materials to finished products, Food Factory goes behind the scenes to reveal 
how some American favourite foods are made. 

 
10.00 a-ok: KNOCKOUT (Sr 7 / Ep 6 / Local Info-ed) (益智节目)  

This week, joget the night away, visit the Taj Mahal, catch some twirling action and slip 
into the smooth rhythms of the Jazz challenge. Crank up the arts, only on KNOCKOUT: 
CARNIVAL! 
   

10.30 a-ok: Under 18 (Ep 6 / Local Info-ed / 2nd Telecast) (益智节目)  

‘Under18’ is a heart-warming documentary that uncovers young and talented, budding 
artists in the Singapore – from musicians to painters to sculptors and dancers, giving an 
insight into their lives as they pursue their passion. 

 

11.00  a-ok: Ade In Britain (Sr 2 / Ep 25 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Adrian Edmondson visits West Scotland. He heads to sea with a local scampi fisherman, 
tries his hand at playing the bagpipes, and learns about the country’s most famous 
delicacy, haggis. Before leaving the region he cooks up a sweet treat for a local fiddle 
player. 

 
12.00MN         Close 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
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okto  WEDNESDAY 7  MAY 2014 
                 

 

9.00AM           Maya The Bee (Eps 43 - 44 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
A young bee named Maya has left her hive to discover the beauty and mysteries of nature. As she 
explores the meadow where she lives, she meets other insects living there, plays to her heart's 
content and shares her joy with her friends. Constantly amazed by her discoveries, Maya's 
enthusiasm is contagious! 

 
9.30   Postman Pat SDS 2 (Eps 15 - 16 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The continuing adventures of everyone's favorite Postman Pat and his beloved cat Jess! 
 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 2 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every episode, 
our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a mission with a 
specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic ROCKET, and together 
they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 

10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 4 / Ep 2 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 
11.00  Franklin & Friends (Season 2 / Ep 26 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

New episodes of Franklin the turtle and his friends. 
 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 21 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful characters 
that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting friends, and 
sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 12 / Eps 5 - 6 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an enhanced 
look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the adventures of a 
cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life lessons. 

 

12.30PM         Octonauts (Season 1 / Ep 25 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The Octonauts are a crew of eight adorable animals who explore the ocean in search of adventure 
and fun! From their undersea "Octopod" base, the eight talented critters are always ready to 
embark on new exciting missions. 

 
 
 
 
 



1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 2 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every episode, 
our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a mission with a 
specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic ROCKET, and together 
they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
1.30  Between The Lions (Sr 4 / Ep 2 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the literacy skills of 
its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

2.00  Franklin & Friends (Season 2 / Ep 26 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

New episodes of Franklin the turtle and his friends. 
 
 

okto  WEDNESDAY 7  MAY 2014 
 

 

2.30PM William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 21 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful characters 
that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting friends, and 
sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00 oktOriginal: R.E.M. – The Next Generation (Eps 11 – 12 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (

电视剧) 
It’s the return of R.E.M. – bigger, better, and with fresh, new faces! Initially brought together against 
their will, Roxy, Elle and M are the latest incarnation of the now-legendary trio, R.E.M!  

 

4.00  oktOriginal: Street Racers (Eps 1 - 2 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 
Get ready for some high-octane action as we speed through our heritage trails on Street Racers! 
Each week, our guides pair up with 2 contestants each for a Street Racers Challenge.  The first 
team to finish the race will become our Street Racers Champion! Willthey have the drive to finish 
the race? Who will emerge the winner? 

 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 17 - 18 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they travel 
around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is BYRD a 
handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" floating through time 
and space. 

 

5.30  Transformers Rescue Bots (Season 1 / Ep 22 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
Meet the Rescue Bots! Chase, Heatwave, Blades and Boulder ate given a very important mission 
by Optimus Prime: protect and learn about mankind. Stationed undercover on a technologically 
advanced island, they team up with a family of 1st responders. With help f Cody, they keep peace 
and people safe. 

 

6.00  Voltron Force (Ep 24 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 
The classic Voltron series has been re-made for a new generation! Action-packed and gripping 

animation series. 
 

6.30          SpongeBob SquarePants (Ep 135 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  
For the world's favourite sea sponge, SpongeBob, his best friend Patrick, and the other residents of 
the tropical Bikini Bottom, life is a series of nautical and often nonsensical adventures. 

 

 



 

7.00  Scooby-Doo! Mystery Incorporated (Season 1 / Ep 3 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
A sleepy little village, Crystal Cove boasts a long history of ghost sightings, poltergeists, demon 
possessions, phantoms and other paranormal occurrences. The renowned sleuthing team of Fred, 
Daphne, Velma, Shaggy and Scooby-Doo prove all of this simply isn't real, and along the way, 
uncover a larger, season-long mystery that will change everything. 

 

7.30   Totally Spies (Sr 6 / Ep 12 / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 
The girls are back to fight more crime for WHOOP! Follow their ongoing journey in the exciting and 
dangerous world of international espionage, all whilst juggling school and their studies! 

 
 
8.00  Crash & Bernstein (Yr 1 / Ep 5 / Schoolkids) (PG)  

When Wyatt's intramural basketball coach quits due to Crash's relentless heckling, Crash steps in 
as the new coach in hopes of breaking their losing streak. But after he benches Wyatt and hires an 
NBA player, Crash learns that winning isn't always everything. Meanwhile, Cleo agrees to supply 
Wyatt's team with basketball jerseys and hires Amanda to work for her fashion company. 

 

8.30  Kitchen Whiz (Sr 4 / Ep 5 / Info-ed / Schoolkids) (益智节目)   
Kitchen Whiz is a fast, fabulous, food focussed game show for kids. A 4-course menu of messy, 
hands on quick cooking and food competition, keeps contestants on their toes as they race around 
the super stocked Kitchn Whiz Pantry. 2 teams of junior chefs compete in fun, messy and tactile 
tasks. 

 
 
 
okto WEDNESDAY 7 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM     ANIMAL NIGHT: Wild Kingdom (Ep 4 / Info-ed) (With Chinese Subtitles) (益智节目)  

The fading sun brings an energy change to Britain: a time of storms and unpredictable 
weather. The trees go dormant, but not before a final fling of colour. For animals, the 
shortening days are a cue to prepare, hibernating and hoarding for the dark times ahead. 
For some, its still a time to breed; deer rut, seals give birth and the Atlantic salmon leaps 
waterfalls in order to lay its eggs. Beneath the fallen leaves, slime moulds, earthworms 
and fungi take advantage of autumn's spoils. 
 

10.00   a-ok: Vintage Hunter (Sr 2 / Ep 5 / Local Info-ed / 2nd Telecast) (益智节目)  

Like a pirate looking for buried treasure Dominic Johnson-Hill sets off again in series two 
of VINTAGE HUNTER. Armed with nothing but his wallet and his instinct for quality 
vintage, antiques and collectibles, he navigates his way across the continents from China 
to New Zealand, meeting fellow obsessive collectors, extraordinary experts and other 
intriguing locals. 

 

11.00  a-ok: Takeshi Art Beat (Eps 4 - 5 / Info-ed / 2nd Telecast) (益智节目)  

Takeshi Kitanao takes a fresh and close look at the creative process of Japanese sculptor 
Atsuhiko Misawa whose wooden animals have been a sensation in the wood-carving 
world.  He visits a long-time personal friend, Nobuyoshi Araki.  Araki is a famous 
photographer whose pictures of his own daily life, wife and everyday scenes have exerted 
an enormous influence on later generations of photographers in Japan. 

 
12.00MN         Close 

 



 
 
MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
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okto  THURSDAY 8 MAY 2014 
 
 

9.00AM           Maya The Bee (Eps 45 – 46 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

A young bee named Maya has left her hive to discover the beauty and mysteries of nature. 
As she explores the meadow where she lives, she meets other insects living there, plays 
to her heart's content and shares her joy with her friends. Constantly amazed by her 
discoveries, Maya's enthusiasm is contagious! 

 

9.30   Postman Pat SDS 2 (Eps 17 - 18 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The continuing adventures of everyone's favorite Postman Pat and his beloved cat Jess! 
 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 3 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 

10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 4 / Ep 3 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

11.00   Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 1 / Debut / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the 
process of learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young 
children feel as they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of 
humor to the everyday challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 22 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 12 / Eps 7 - 8 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 

 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 1 - 2 / Debut / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get the 
answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches of 
outer space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - and 
the top - of the question. 

 



1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 3 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
 
 
 

okto  THURSDAY 8 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM Between The Lions (Sr 4 / Ep 3 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 1 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 22 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Dream School (Eps 3 - 4 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 

A group of kids enrol into a school for the performing arts. This musical drama series is 
about their trials and tribulations as they try to fit into a creative environment to nurture 
their special gifts.  
 

4.00  oktOriginal: Saved Or Slimed (Sr 2 / Eps 3 - 4 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

This season of the zany children’s game show, it is fun-filled, educational and definitely 
wet! The game show challenges the Mental, Physical & Social aspects of the participants.  
Each week sees three schools racing to save their school mate.  
 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 19 - 20 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 

5.30  Transformers Rescue Bots (Season 1 / Ep 23 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Meet the Rescue Bots! Chase, Heatwave, Blades and Boulder ate given a very important 
mission by Optimus Prime: protect and learn about mankind. Stationed undercover on a 
technologically advanced island, they team up with a family of 1st responders. With help f 
Cody, they keep peace and people safe. 

 
 
 
 
 



6.00  Planet Sheen (Season 1 / Ep 6 / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片) 

After sneaking into his best friend Jimmy Neutron's laboratory, Sheen accidentally blasts 
himself into outer space in Jimmy's top-secret rocketship! Sheen crash-lands on Planet 
Zeenu and ends up having crazy adventures with the Zeenuians while trying to survive the 
evil plots of Dorkus. 

 

6.30       Johnny Test (Sr 6 / Ep 8 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

New season of Johnny Test and his dog Dukey wacky adventures! 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

okto  THURSDAY 8 MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM Scooby-Doo! Mystery Incorporated (Season 1 / Ep 4 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

A sleepy little village, Crystal Cove boasts a long history of ghost sightings, poltergeists, 
demon possessions, phantoms and other paranormal occurrences. The renowned 
sleuthing team of Fred, Daphne, Velma, Shaggy and Scooby-Doo prove all of this simply 
isn't real, and along the way, uncover a larger, season-long mystery that will change 
everything. 
 

7.30  Dude, That‘s My Ghost! (Eps 33 – 34 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Dude, That’s My Ghost! follows the adventures of 14-year-old Spencer when he moves to 
Hollywood with  his family and has to adjust to life with his new buddy, the ghost of uber-
famous pop star, Billy Joe Cobra.  
 

8.00  oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 5 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R)  

(益智节目)   

The Head Prefect is out for revenge. She abuses her power and makes the Primary 3 
prefects do errands for her. Justin takes matters into his own hands and kidnaps the Head 
Prefect to teach her a lesson. 

 

8.30  oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 5 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

Nikki throws and kicks different types of balls at objects inside the house. Aiken finds out 
just how dangerous killer litter can be. Mr Know It All learns the hard way that leaving toys 
on the floor can be painful.  

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



okto THURSDAY 8 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM           DOCUMENTARY: Wild Case Files: Alien Squid Invasion (Ep 5 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Millions of mice invade and destroy a family wheat farm in southern Australia; thousands 
of wildebeest drown mysteriously in a Kenyan river on their annual migration; and the 
voracious Humboldt squids invade the Californian coast, eating anything in their path. 

 
10.00  a-ok: Island Feast With Peter Kuruvita (Ep 6 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

This series takes Australian chef Peter Kuruvita into some of the world’s most fascinating 
island communities, where he discovers the vibrant intricacies of island life and the 
tradition, passion and flair behind local cuisines. 
 

10.30  a-ok: Luke Nguyen’s Greater Mekong Part 1 (Ep 6 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

Luke Nguyen ventures to Myanmar’s Shan State, where entire villages and kilometres of 
tomato farms float on Inle Lake. He cooks Chickpea Tofu Soup, Green Tomato Salad, and 
Spring Onion Fritters. 
 

11.00   a-ok: The Private Lives Of Medieval Kings (Ep 3 / Info-ed) (益智节目)    

The story of the British Library's Royal Manuscripts collection reaches its end with the last 
great flowering of illumination, in the magnificent courts of the Tudors. Dr Janina Ramirez 
investigates astrological texts created for Henry VII, and unwraps his will - still in its 
original, extravagantly-decorated cover.  
 

12.00MN         Close 
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okto  FRIDAY 9 MAY 2014 
 
9.00AM          Maya The Bee (Eps 47 – 48 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

A young bee named Maya has left her hive to discover the beauty and mysteries of nature. 
As she explores the meadow where she lives, she meets other insects living there, plays 
to her heart's content and shares her joy with her friends. Constantly amazed by her 
discoveries, Maya's enthusiasm is contagious! 

 

9.30   Postman Pat SDS 2 (Eps 19 - 20 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The continuing adventures of everyone's favorite Postman Pat and his beloved cat Jess! 
 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 4 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 4 / Ep 4 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 



11.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 2 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 23 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 12 / Eps 9 - 10 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 

 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 3 - 4 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get the 
answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches of outer 
space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - and the top - of 
the question. 

 

1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 4 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 
 
 

okto  FRIDAY 9 MAY 2014 
 
1.30PM Between The Lions (Sr 4 / Ep 4 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 2 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 23 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Nick Of Time (Eps 3 - 4 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 

A fun adventure drama series, Nick of Time is about improving our way of life, conserving 
nature and how we all have a part to play to make a better future for everyone. 

 
 



4.00  oktOriginal: Little Great Givers (Eps 3 - 4 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

“Little Great Givers” reveals another face of young Singaporeans - socially conscious and 
responsible individuals who go beyond their means to help others. 

 

5.00 oktOriginal: The Badge (Ep 6 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

“The Badge” is a science show that combines passion and compassion.  Each episode will 
feature a team of young inventors, also known as ‘Scientific Social Workers’, working to 
conceptualize and build a Great Invention to solve the real-life problems of different 
profiles.  

 

5.30  Super Yoyo (Ep 6 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Shunichi Domoto is a talented sportie 5th grade boy who used to help sport teams in his 
school. He enters a Yoyo duel against a bully boy called Benkei to help his friend, Beso, to 
get back his Yoyo and won the yoyo battle. However, he meets the exceptionally gifted 
Yoyo-er, Seito Hojoin who beat him because he ridiculed Yoyo game .So, Shunichi enters 
the Japan`s Yoyo championship to get his revenge with Seito.  

 

6.00  oktOriginal: KNOCKOUT (Sr 7 / Ep 6 / Local Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

This week, joget the night away, visit the Taj Mahal, catch some twirling action and slip 
into the smooth rhythms of the Jazz challenge. Crank up the arts, only on KNOCKOUT: 
CARNIVAL! 

 

6.30      Johnny Test (Sr 6 / Ep 9 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

New season of Johnny Test and his dog Dukey wacky adventures! 
 

7.00  Ooglies (Ep 7 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

A quirky and wacky series of shorts featuring vegetables and household objects brought to 
stop-motion, animated life! 

  

7.15   Great Eastern YEO’s S.League 2014: Hougang United VS Balestier Khalsa (Sports / 
LIVE)  

 
 
 
 
okto  FRIDAY 9 MAY 2014 
 
9.30PM          ANIMAL NIGHT: Nature’s Microworlds (Ep 11 / Info-ed) (With Chinese Subtitles)  

(益智节目)  

Nature’s Microworlds takes viewers on a fascinating journey, offering a definitive guide to 
some very special places on Earth. 

 

10.00 a-ok: Sherlock (Sr 2 / Ep 2 / Drama) (电视剧) (PG 13 – Horror) 

Sherlock’s most famous case. A Hound from Hell. A terrified man. But is a monster really 
stalking Dartmoor? What seems like fantasy in Baker Street is a very different prospect in 
the ultra-secret army base that looms over the moor. 
 

12.00MN        Close 
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okto  SATURDAY 10 MAY 2014 
 

7.00AM           oktOriginal: Zoom, Zim, Zam (Eps 11 - 12 / Local Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

“Zoom Zim Zam” is a, phonics based educational pre-school series.  The series features 
Zoomba, Zimba and Zamba literacy superheroes. Who together with their friends learn 
about the world around them and the sounds that alphabets make. The series will feature 
original songs and Dance as part of the programme. 
 

8.00           Sesame Street (Season 40 / Ep 1 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

The beloved Sesame Street gang return in a refreshed show format, complete with new 
guest stars, and a brand new opening theme song! 

 

9.00  My Little Pony: Friendship Is Magic (Season 2 / Ep 14 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片)  

More magical adventures in Equestria and Ponyville, with Twilight Sparkle and her best 
pony gal friends not forgetting Spike, of course! 
 

9.30  Winx Club (Sr 4 / Ep 1 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片)  

This season delivers an enthralling and intense story plot but with a stronger dose of 
comedy than previously.  At Alphea college the new school year is about to begin, 
however the pleasant atmosphere is ruined by the Fairy Hunters who attack the school 
and defeat the Winx.  The Winx decide to go to Earth to Save the Last Fairy. 
 

10.00  Pokemon: BW Adventures In Unova And Beyond (Sr 16 / Ep 19 / Schoolkids / Cartoon)  

(卡通片)  

After discovering a festival celebrating the sights and sounds of the Kanto region, Ash 
reunites with an old friend, who shows what real staying power is all about! 
 

 
 

10.30  Planet Sheen (Season 1 / Ep 7 / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片) 

After sneaking into his best friend Jimmy Neutron's laboratory, Sheen accidentally blasts 
himself into outer space in Jimmy's top-secret rocketship! Sheen crash-lands on Planet 
Zeenu and ends up having crazy adventures with the Zeenuians while trying to survive the 
evil plots of Dorkus. 

 

11.00  Little Battlers eXperience (Sr 2 / Ep 21 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

This is the story about two main heroes who love LBX and defend the world from tyranny 
with nothing but their LBX! 
 

11.30  Power Rangers Mega Force (Ep 7 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Five teenagers with talent and attitude to form the ultimate team...the Power Rangers 
Megaforce! Using their new found special abilities, mega-weapons, high-tech Zords and 
giant Megazords to battle this new alien threat. 
 



12.00NN oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 6 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids) (益智节目)   

Justin realizes that it is not all fun being a prefect. He is feeling the heat of prefects’ 
responsibilities and the demands of school work. Together with Sheila the fairy, their 
science project fails to hit the mark and he has to race against time to get it done. 

 
 
 
 

okto  SATURDAY 10 MAY 2014 
 

12.30PM       oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 6 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids) (益智节目)   

Nikki demonstrates what a blender can do to your toys and your fingers! Aiken shows us 
the wrong way to do laundry. Mr Know It All eats too fast.  

  
1.00  Adventurers Masters Of Time (Eps 11 - 12 / Schoolkids / R)  

Four school friends are suddenly whisked back through the ages on a desperate search 
for their missing computer professor - by uploading themselves by way of a time 
continuum software! Unfortunately they haven't made the journey alone. An evil hacker is 
threatening to change world history. 

 
2.00  Kaijudo (Eps 9 - 10 / Schoolkids / R)  

Ray, a 14-year-old who lives with his mom and granddad, has been recruited by the Duel 
Masters to study Kaijudo: The Way of the Creature. They chose Ray for his natural talent 
as a creature tamer and duelist. 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: GX5 (Eps 9 - 10 / Local Drama / R) (电视剧)  

In this action-adventure series, 5 Kids/Teens comes across an email invite to a brand new 
online game called Game Xtreme, and unwittingly find themselves – trapped in it!  As they 
try to find ways and means to get out from their predicament, they realise that there’s a 
strong opposing force who’s trying to keep them in it and he’s none other than the Evil 
villain – SPAM! 

 
4.01 oktOriginal: The Mad Science Manual (Eps 9 - 10 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R)  

(益智节目) 
Science is mad…fun! Or at least it is when you know how. A series of sixteen episodes that inspire 
home made scientific experiments that send the imagination racing, all the while encouraging kids - 

and the occasional adult - to ask 'WHY?'  

 
 

5.00 Edebits (Eps 21 – 22 / Schoolkids / Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

  Edebits is the ecological series of the moment! Guided by Bet and her inseparable friends, 
the edebits, boys and girls will learn and discover about issues such as environmental 
awareness or climate change.  

   

5.30 Wendy (Ep 4 / Cartoon / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 

The show charts the adventures of teenage heroine, Wendy and focuses on her equestrian 
centered life. Living on a stud-farm, complete with a riding school and stables, Wendy has 
become an accomplished rider and show jumper; her life is full of gossip, friendships and 
romances. 

   
 
 



6.00  Martha Speaks Part 2 (Ep 15 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

New episodes about Martha, a beloved family dog who is accidentally fed alphabet soup, 
giving her the power of speech and the chance to speak her mind to anyone to anyone 
that will listen, often with hilarious consequences!  

 

6.30  Oscar’s Oasis (Ep 19 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Hilarious 3D animated, non-dialogue series in the style of Looney Tunes. Oscar, the lonely 
desert lizard, battles the rigeurs of the desert as well as his un-neighbourly fellow 
inhabitants, from chickens to mischievous meerkats. 

 
 
 
 

okto  SATURDAY 10 MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM     Pokemon: Black & White (Season 15 / Ep 27 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

The continuing adventures of Ash Ketchum and Pikachu as they continue traveling though 
Unova with friends Cilan and Iris, to take on his remaining five gym badges. 

 

7.30  ThunderCats (Ep 11 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

THUNDERCATS presents the grand origin story of Prince Lion-O's ascension to the 
throne and those who would thwart his destiny at any cost and takes on epic dimensions 
in this sharp new telling. 
 

8.00  Mudpit (Ep 20 / Schoolkids / R)  
You ready to ROCK?! You ready to LAUGH?! Then you're ready for... MUDPIT! A live-
action/animated comedy series about four teens that form a virtual rock band in hopes of 
becoming real rock stars! 

 

8.30  Fort Boyard Ultimate Challenge (Srs 1 & 2 / Ep 3 / Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Fort Boyard - Ultimate Challenge is the ultimate adventure series where 24 teens from the 
United States and the United Kingdom compete as teams in a series of exciting 
challenges designed to test their brainpower, courage and teamwork! 
 

 
  

okto  SATURDAY 10 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM oktoLIFE: Koala Hospital (Info-ed) (益智节目)  

The world’s first Koala Hospital in Australia and its community of volunteers care for sick 
and injured wild koalas, giving them a second chance at life. Filmmaker Susan Kelly 
documents wild behaviour and life at the hospital over three years, capturing 
unprecedented footage of koala communication, dramatic rescues, heartfelt emotion and 
amusing koala antics.  

 
10.00  CENTRESTAGE: Alonzo King Lines Ballet – Scheherazade (Culture)  

The celebrated choreographer Alonzo King’s Scheherazade is a re-envisioning of the 
ancient collection of Persian, Sanskrit and Arabic stories of 1,001 Nights. The new score 
by tabla master Zakir Hussain re-interprets the original music by Rimsky-Korsakov, 
incorporating traditional Persian as well as Western instruments.  

 
 



10.00  CENTRESTAGE: Alonzo King Lines Ballet – Dust And Light (Culture)  
Alonzo King’s ballet Dust and Light is set to baroque music by Arcangelo Corelli and 
Francis Poulenc.  In a landscape that shifts like the clouds, dappling the stage with soft 
light and then bathing the dancers in silvery radiance, Alonzo King brings out the 
emotional intimacy of dance.  

 
12.00MN       Close 
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okto SUNDAY 11 MAY 2014 
 

7.00AM           oktOriginal: Club M.A.G.I.C (Eps 11 – 12 / Local Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

CLUB M.A.G.I.C was developed to enrich the learning experience of preschoolers by 
creating a purposeful teaching environment that nurtures their holistic development. The 
series celebrates the joy of learning while encouraging children to adopt a positive, can-do 
attitude whenever they embark on a task.  

 

8.00           LazyTown (Season 1 / Eps 30 – 31 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
In LazyTown, Stephanie and Sportacus are always trying to helps the kids to live active lifestyles, 
while thwarting the schemes of the world’s laziest super-villain, Robbie Rotten! A funny, fresh show. 

 

9.00 Stuart Little: The Animated Series (Ep 4 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
Everyones favorite Little guy returns in this fun-filled animated adventure series.  Whether he’s 
exploring the great outdoors, skate boarding with his brother George or in pursuit of Taco Tuesday, 

Stuart Little brings his trademark heart and humor sure to delight the whole family. 
 

9.31 The Adventures Of Tintin (Ep 30 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) (PG) 

The original TinTin animated series featuring the classic adventures of the globetrotting 
young journalist, TinTin, and his dog, Snowy. 
 

10.00  Buddy Fight (Ep 15 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Trading card based Japanese anime series. Children form a contract with creatures, also 
known as their buddy, and fight as a tag team combination. 

 

10.30  Cardfight Vanguard (Sr 3 / Ep 31 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Exciting 3rd season of Cardfight Vanguard. 
 

11.00  Little Battlers eXperience (Sr 2 / Ep 22 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

This is the story about two main heroes who love LBX and defend the world from tyranny 
with nothing but their LBX! 

 

11.30  Jackie Chan Adventures (Season 3 / Ep 13 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
Jackie Chan teams up in this anime-style animated adventure with his 11-year-old niece, Jade, 

traveling the globe to locate a dozen magical talismans before the sinister Dark Hand does. 

 
 



12.00NN Robotboy (Season 2 / Eps 11 - 12 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Created by world-renowned scientist Professor Moshimo, Robotboy attracts the diabolical 
attention of supervillains intent on harnessing Robotboy's powers to enslave the world. So 
Moshimo sends Robotboy far away to live with his number one fan, Tommy. 

 
12.30PM Geronimo Stilton (Ep 6 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Geronimo Stilton is an exciting animated adventure-comedy series that follows the adventures of 
the famous - Geronimo Stilton – erudite mouse, head of a veritable media empire and klutz 
extraordinaire and Benjamin Stilton his fearless and smart 12 year old nephew.   

 

1.00  The Ugly Duckling & Me (Ep 1 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 
We are all familiar with Hans Christian Andersen's tale of the ugly duckling who became a swan. 
But what a lot of people don't know is that, along the way, the same duckling was adopted by 
Ratso, a city rat hiding out in a duckyard full of farm animals! 

 
 
okto SUNDAY 11 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM The Adventures Of Paddington Bear (Ep 18 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Follow the adventures of the well-loved classic bear. 
 

2.00 Dirt Girl World (Eps 21 - 22 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Uniquely animated series with an environmental focus, e.g. exploring recycling and 
growing your own vegetables. 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: My Classmate Dad (Sr 2 / Eps 1 – 2 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 
This season brings about a body switch adventure with a whole new twist!  Uncle Adyson and 
nephew Chee Meng are still stuck in each other’s body as a result of a literally electrifying and 
mysterious pendant, and the hunt continues for an end to their unfortunate plight. 

 

4.00  oktOriginal: Word Champs (Eps 11 – 12 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Word Champs challenges 3 kids to solve fun word games to receive points, gifts & get 
messy for the chance to win an exciting grand prize. 

 

5.00 Oscar The Balloonist (Eps 13 – 14 / Cartoon / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片)  

Join the exiting adventures of eight-year-old Oscar, who travels the world in his hot air 
balloon together with his trusted companion, Spike the Cactus!  
 

5.30 Wendy (Ep 5 / Cartoon / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 
The show charts the adventures of teenage heroine, Wendy and focuses on her equestrian 
centered life. Living on a stud-farm, complete with a riding school and stables, Wendy has become 
an accomplished rider and show jumper; her life is full of gossip, friendships and romances. 

 

6.00  Martha Speaks Part 2 (Ep 16 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

New episodes about Martha, a beloved family dog who is accidentally fed alphabet soup, 
giving her the power of speech and the chance to speak her mind to anyone to anyone 
that will listen, often with hilarious consequences!  
 

6.30 Oscar’s Oasis (Ep 20 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Hilarious 3D animated, non-dialogue series in the style of Looney Tunes. Oscar, the lonely 
desert lizard, battles the rigeurs of the desert as well as his un-neighbourly fellow 
inhabitants, from chickens to mischievous meerkats. 



 

7.00      Pokemon: Black & White (Season 15 / Ep 28 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

The continuing adventures of Ash Ketchum and Pikachu as they continue traveling though 
Unova with friends Cilan and Iris, to take on his remaining five gym badges. 

 

7.30  ThunderCats (Ep 12 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

THUNDERCATS presents the grand origin story of Prince Lion-O's ascension to the 
throne and those who would thwart his destiny at any cost and takes on epic dimensions 
in this sharp new telling. 

 
8.00  Mudpit (Ep 21 / Schoolkids / R)  

You ready to ROCK?! You ready to LAUGH?! Then you're ready for... MUDPIT! A live-
action/animated comedy series about four teens that form a virtual rock band in hopes of 
becoming real rock stars! 
 

8.30  The S.League Show (Ep 11 / Local Sports)  
All the goals and best action from another week of the S.League rolled into one show. The 
best football clubs in Singapore battle it out to be crowned S.League champions at the end 
of the season. 

 
 
 

okto SUNDAY 11 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM          Doctor Who (Sr 7 / Ep 8 / Drama) (电视剧)  

The Doctor and his companion, Clara Oswald, land on a Soviet submarine in 1983 during 
the Cold War, where the Ice Warrior Grand Marshall Skaldak breaks loose and plots 
revenge against humanity. 
 

10.00  FILMART: Rescue Dawn (Movie) (艺 术 影 院) (PG - Violence) 

Based on the astonishing true story of Dieter Dengler, a U.S. Navy pilot struggles to 
survive in a hellish prison camp after being shot down during the Vietnam War. Starring 
Christian Bale, Steve Zahn, Jeremy Davies, Marshall Bell and Zach Grenier. 
 

12.15AM         Close  
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okto MONDAY 12 MAY 2014 
 

 

9.00AM           Maya The Bee (Eps 49 - 50 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
A young bee named Maya has left her hive to discover the beauty and mysteries of nature. As she 
explores the meadow where she lives, she meets other insects living there, plays to her heart's 
content and shares her joy with her friends. Constantly amazed by her discoveries, Maya's 
enthusiasm is contagious! 

 

9.30   Postman Pat SDS 2 (Eps 21 - 22 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The continuing adventures of everyone's favorite Postman Pat and his beloved cat Jess! 
 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 5 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 4 / Ep 5 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

11.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 3 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 24 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 12 / Eps 11 - 12 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an enhanced 
look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the adventures of a 
cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life lessons.  

 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 5 - 6 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get 
the answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches 
of outer space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - 
and the top - of the question. 

 
 
 
 
 



1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 5 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
okto MONDAY 12 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM Between The Lions (Sr 4 / Ep 5 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 3 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  
Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of learning 
themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as they learn to 
navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 24 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Zero Hero (Eps 1 - 2 / Local Drama / R) (电视剧)  

Zero Hero is a series revolving around a Singaporean superhero family, The Magnificent 
Heroes, who have mysteriously lost all their super powers and now struggle to be like the 
average human being. Every week, a super villain from their past resurfaces, and it’s up to 
our superheroes with no super powers to foil them. 

 
4.00  oktOriginal: The Mad Science Manual (Eps 11 - 12 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R)  

(益智节目) 

Science is mad…fun! Or at least it is when you know how. A series of sixteen episodes 
that inspire home made scientific experiments that send the imagination racing, all the 
while encouraging kids - and the occasional adult - to ask 'WHY?'  

 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 21 - 22 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they travel 
around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is BYRD a 
handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" floating through time 
and space. 

 

5.30  Transformers Rescue Bots (Season 1 / Ep 24 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
Meet the Rescue Bots! Chase, Heatwave, Blades and Boulder ate given a very important mission 
by Optimus Prime: protect and learn about mankind. Stationed undercover on a technologically 
advanced island, they team up with a family of 1st responders. With help f Cody, they keep peace 
and people safe. 

 

6.00  oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 6 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   
Justin realizes that it is not all fun being a prefect. He is feeling the heat of prefects’ responsibilities 
and the demands of school work. Together with Sheila the fairy, their science project fails to hit the 
mark and he has to race against time to get it done. 

  

 
 



6.30     okto @ The Movies: Scooby-Doo! Music Of The Vampire (Movie / Schoolkids)  
When Daphne becomes the star of a vampire film, the production is thrown into chaos when 
a real vampire shows up, forcing the gang to investigate who's behind the mayhem! 

  

8.30 Tricky TV (Sr 3 / Ep 18 / Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

In this season, host & magician Stephen Mulhern returns with a talented cast of young 
trickers to boogle the brains of the viewing public with amazing magic and stunts. 
 

 
 
okto MONDAY 12 MAY 2014 
 
9.00PM           ANIMAL NIGHT: Built For The Kill: Lion (Season 4 / Ep 1 / Info-ed) (With Chinese 

Subtitles) (益智节目)  

This episode shows how the lions on the African savannah hunt and kill their prey, such as 
the zebra, the buffalo, the giraffe, and even the elephant. 

 
10.00  a-ok: Antiques Road Trip (Sr 7 / Ep 5 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Charles Hanson and Christina Trevanion travel from Harrogate to York, Northallerton, 
Masham and Richmond, before rounding off their trip at an auction in Cobridge, Stoke-on-
Trent. The antiques they buy in this episode include a brooch, a Liberty-style cabinet, and 
a cricket ball from the late Victorian period.  

 

11.00   a-ok: Arts.21 (Ep 141 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

On this week's show: the westerns make a cinema comeback; reappraising the legacy of a 
fashion photography pioneer; and a profile of German visual artist Johannes Kahrs.  

 

11.30   a-ok: Euromaxx (Ep 141 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

Topics include Polish conductor Krzysztof Urbanski, German industrial designer 
Konstantin Grcic, Europe’s biggest outdoor park, and a Berlin photographer’s portrayal of 
her city. 

 
12.00MN         Close 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 

MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
Daily Programme Listing 
 

okto TUESDAY 13 MAY 2014 
 

 

9.00AM           Maya The Bee (Eps 51 - 52 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

A young bee named Maya has left her hive to discover the beauty and mysteries of nature. 
As she explores the meadow where she lives, she meets other insects living there, plays 
to her heart's content and shares her joy with her friends. Constantly amazed by her 
discoveries, Maya's enthusiasm is contagious! 

 

9.30   Postman Pat SDS 2 (Eps 23 - 24 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The continuing adventures of everyone's favorite Postman Pat and his beloved cat Jess! 
 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 6 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every episode, 
our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a mission with a 
specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic ROCKET, and together 
they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 

10.30  VESAK DAY 2014: The Sylvanian Family Special (Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Discover the enchanting world of Sylvania, home to the Sylvanian Families, in this 
all new CGI animated special. Join all your favourite characters as they learn the 
importance of family, friendship and the magic of play. 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 12 / Eps 13 - 14 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 
 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 7 - 8 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get 
the answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches 
of outer space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - 
and the top - of the question. 

 

1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 6 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every episode, 
our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a mission with a 
specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic ROCKET, and together 
they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 

1.30  Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 1 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 



2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 4 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 

okto TUESDAY 13 MAY 2014 
 

2.30PM William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 25 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
3.00 oktOriginal: oktOriginal: My Classmate Dad (Sr 2 / Eps 3 – 4 / Local Drama / Schoolkids 

/ R) (电视剧) 

This season brings about a body switch adventure with a whole new twist!  Uncle Adyson 
and nephew Chee Meng are still stuck in each other’s body as a result of a literally 
electrifying and mysterious pendant, and the hunt continues for an end to their unfortunate 
plight. 
 

4.00  oktOriginal: Team Word (Eps 1 – 2 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Scrumble, Fumble and Tumble your way in this word game show that not only tests your 
spelling abilities, but your speed, agility and teamwork skills as well!  Each week, two 
teams pit against each other using big letter tiles in three different challenges.   

 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 23 - 24 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 

5.30  Transformers Rescue Bots (Season 1 / Ep 25 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Meet the Rescue Bots! Chase, Heatwave, Blades and Boulder ate given a very important 
mission by Optimus Prime: protect and learn about mankind. Stationed undercover on a 
technologically advanced island, they team up with a family of 1st responders. With help f 
Cody, they keep peace and people safe. 

 

6.00 oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 6 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)  

Nikki demonstrates what a blender can do to your toys and your fingers! Aiken shows us 
the wrong way to do laundry. Mr Know It All eats too fast.  
 

 
 
 
 
 



6.30            VESAK DAY 2014: Zambezia (Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

Set in a bustling bird city on the edge of the majestic Victoria Falls, "Zambezia" is 
the story of Kai - a nave, but high-spirited young falcon who travels to the bird city 
of "Zambezia" where he discovers the truth about his origins and, in defending the 
city, learns how to be part of a community. 

 
8.00  Just Kidding (Ep 23 / Schoolkids) 

Just Kidding is a prank show hosted by Zach Fox. 
 

8.30  Lab Rats Challenge (Sr 2 / Ep 5 / Schoolkids / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

In every show two teams made up of pairs of friends compete in a range of science based 
challenges. Each team is assigned a host who commentate on what is happening and how 
it works. They talk to team members about their tactics, progress and feelings.  

 
 
 

okto TUESDAY 13 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM          DOCUMENTARY: Food Factory 3 (Eps 11 - 12 / Info-ed) (益智节目) 

From raw materials to finished products, Food Factory goes behind the scenes to reveal 
how some American favourite foods are made. 

 
10.00 a-ok: KNOCKOUT (Sr 7 / Ep 7 / Local Info-ed) (益智节目)  

This week, it gets heated with melted crayon art, fun-tastic school events, one hit wonders, 
a twirly line-up of arts treats and a one of kind Rondalla challenge. It’s art, art  and more 
art, only on KNOCKOUT: CARNIVAL! 
   

10.30 a-ok: ARTreprenuers (Ep 1 / Local Info-ed / 2nd Telecast) (益智节目)  

“ARTreprenuers is a series that explores the world of art and creative endeavors from the 
one thing all Singaporeans understand best: the economy.  Each episode will feature a 
particular segment of Singapore’s diverse field of arts and creative startups, with a unique 
and sustainable revenue model that hold its own against other brick and mortar 
businesses. 
 

11.00  a-ok: Ade In Britain (Sr 2 / Ep 26 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Adrian Edmondson explores Northern Ireland to discover the country's finest foods and 
crafts. He visits a famous apple orchard, is taught the traditional art of basket weaving, 
and uses a local recipe to bake soda bread. A dance group provides entertainment while 
the host prepares an Irish delicacy. 

 
12.00MN         Close 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 

MediaCorp Pte Ltd 

Daily Programme Listing 
 

okto  WEDNESDAY 14  MAY 2014 
                 

9.00AM             Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 3 – 4 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

 

9.30   Postman Pat SDS 2 (Eps 25 - 26 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The continuing adventures of everyone's favorite Postman Pat and his beloved cat Jess! 
 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 7 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 2 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 
11.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 5 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 26 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful characters 
that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting friends, and 
sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 12 / Eps 15 - 16 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an enhanced 
look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the adventures of a 
cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life lessons. 

 
 
 
 
 



 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 9 - 10 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get the 
answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches of outer 
space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - and the top - of 
the question. 

 

1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 7 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every episode, 
our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a mission with a 
specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic ROCKET, and together 
they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
1.30  Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 2 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 
 

okto  WEDNESDAY 14  MAY 2014 
 

2.00PM Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 5 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 26 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
3.00  oktOriginal: R.E.M. – The Next Generation (Ep 13 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R)  

(电视剧) 

It’s the return of R.E.M. – bigger, better, and with fresh, new faces! Initially brought 
together against their will, Roxy, Elle and M are the latest incarnation of the now-legendary 
trio, R.E.M!  
 

3.30  oktOriginal: R.E.M. – The Next Generation (Sr 2 / Ep 1 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R)  

(电视剧) 

This second season sees the terrific trio of Roxy, Elle and M. diving into the heat of the 
action! The question of what happened to Roxy's sister Rachel and the original REM is 
answered while new mysteries unfold.  Along the way, as the series heads towards its 
finale, the girls will encounter intrigue and excitement, as they tackle baddies while lending 
a helping hand to those in need. 

 

4.00  oktOriginal: Street Racers (Eps 3 - 4 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Get ready for some high-octane action as we speed through our heritage trails on Street 
Racers! Each week, our guides pair up with 2 contestants each for a Street Racers 
Challenge.  The first team to finish the race will become our Street Racers Champion! 
Willthey have the drive to finish the race? Who will emerge the winner? 
 

 



5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 25 - 26 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 

5.30  Transformers Rescue Bots (Season 1 / Ep 26 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Meet the Rescue Bots! Chase, Heatwave, Blades and Boulder ate given a very important 
mission by Optimus Prime: protect and learn about mankind. Stationed undercover on a 
technologically advanced island, they team up with a family of 1st responders. With help f 
Cody, they keep peace and people safe. 

 

6.00  Voltron Force (Ep 25 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

The classic Voltron series has been re-made for a new generation! Action-packed and 
gripping animation series. 
 

 

6.30          SpongeBob SquarePants (Ep 136 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

For the world's favourite sea sponge, SpongeBob, his best friend Patrick, and the other 
residents of the tropical Bikini Bottom, life is a series of nautical and often nonsensical 
adventures. 

 
 
 
 
 

okto  WEDNESDAY 14  MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM Scooby-Doo! Mystery Incorporated (Season 1 / Ep 5 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

A sleepy little village, Crystal Cove boasts a long history of ghost sightings, poltergeists, 
demon possessions, phantoms and other paranormal occurrences. The renowned 
sleuthing team of Fred, Daphne, Velma, Shaggy and Scooby-Doo prove all of this simply 
isn't real, and along the way, uncover a larger, season-long mystery that will change 
everything. 

 

7.30   Totally Spies (Sr 6 / Ep 13 / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 

The girls are back to fight more crime for WHOOP! Follow their ongoing journey in the 
exciting and dangerous world of international espionage, all whilst juggling school and 
their studies! 

 
8.00  Crash & Bernstein (Yr 1 / Ep 6 / Schoolkids) (PG)  

When Wyatt's intramural basketball coach quits due to Crash's relentless heckling, Crash 
steps in as the new coach in hopes of breaking their losing streak. But after he benches 
Wyatt and hires an NBA player, Crash learns that winning isn't always everything. 
Meanwhile, Cleo agrees to supply Wyatt's team with basketball jerseys and hires Amanda 
to work for her fashion company. 

 

8.30  Kitchen Whiz (Sr 4 / Ep 6 / Info-ed / Schoolkids) (益智节目)   

Kitchen Whiz is a fast, fabulous, food focussed game show for kids. A 4-course menu of 
messy, hands on quick cooking and food competition, keeps contestants on their toes as 
they race around the super stocked Kitchn Whiz Pantry. 2 teams of junior chefs compete 
in fun, messy and tactile tasks. 



 
 
okto WEDNESDAY 14 MAY 2014 
 
9.00PM     ANIMAL NIGHT: Caught In The Act  (Season 4 / Ep 1 / Info-ed) (With Chinese Subtitles)  

(益智节目) (PG) 

One octopus devours another, mountain parrots attack sheep, two elephant seals clash 
with each other, a gazelle fights against baboons for her baby, two killer whales hunting for 
a dolphin, a monkey and a dog play tag on an African beach. Incredible animal behavior is 
captured by professional and amateur videographers and analyzed by top wildlife experts. 
 

10.00   a-ok: Vintage Hunter (Sr 2 / Ep 6 / Local Info-ed / 2nd Telecast) (益智节目)  

Like a pirate looking for buried treasure Dominic Johnson-Hill sets off again in series two 
of VINTAGE HUNTER. Armed with nothing but his wallet and his instinct for quality 
vintage, antiques and collectibles, he navigates his way across the continents from China 
to New Zealand, meeting fellow obsessive collectors, extraordinary experts and other 
intriguing locals. 

 

11.00  a-ok: Takeshi Art Beat (Eps 6 - 7 / Info-ed / 2nd Telecast) (益智节目)  

Takeshi meets Yoshindo Yoshihara, a tenth-generation Japanese sword maker whose 
works are revered and treasured by art museums all over the world.  Nobuyuki Tsujii is a 
talented young Japanese pianist who is blind from birth. He visits Tsujii at a concert hall, 
where the pianist is recording his own compositions, and delves into the sources of his 
creativity. 

 
12.00MN         Close 
 

 
 
MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
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okto  THURSDAY 15 MAY 2014 
 

9.00AM           Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 3 – 4 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

 

9.30   Ella The Elephant (Sr 1 / Ep 1 / Debut / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Sweet and charming, generous and kind, Ella is one little elephant that stands out in 
a crowd. Perhaps it's her bright red hat? Or maybe it's the fact that she's so good at 
helping others. With her buddies Belinda Blue, Frankie and Lola the Monkey, 
laughter and adventure go hand in hand. 

 
 
 



10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 8 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 

10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 3 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

11.00   Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 6 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 27 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 12 / Eps 17 - 18 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 

 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 11 - 12 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get the 
answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches of outer 
space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - and the top - of 
the question. 

 

1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 8 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



okto  THURSDAY 15 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 3 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 6 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 27 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Dream School (Eps 5 – 6 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 

A group of kids enrol into a school for the performing arts. This musical drama series is 
about their trials and tribulations as they try to fit into a creative environment to nurture 
their special gifts.  
 

4.00  oktOriginal: Saved Or Slimed (Sr 2 / Eps 5 - 6 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

This season of the zany children’s game show, it is fun-filled, educational and definitely 
wet! The game show challenges the Mental, Physical & Social aspects of the participants.  
Each week sees three schools racing to save their school mate.  
 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 27 - 28 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 
5.30  Secret Kid Venture Club (Ep 1 / Debut / Schoolkids)  

The Secret KidVenture Club empowers kids by helping them understand the world 
they live in, teaching them about the impact their decisions have on their own 
liveseven when they are 8 years old! Its not about understanding a Balance Sheet 
but rather about the value of ones reputation. 

 

6.00  Planet Sheen (Season 1 / Ep 7 / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片) 

After sneaking into his best friend Jimmy Neutron's laboratory, Sheen accidentally blasts 
himself into outer space in Jimmy's top-secret rocketship! Sheen crash-lands on Planet 
Zeenu and ends up having crazy adventures with the Zeenuians while trying to survive the 
evil plots of Dorkus. 

 

6.30       Johnny Test (Sr 6 / Ep 10 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

New season of Johnny Test and his dog Dukey wacky adventures! 
 
 
 
 
 



okto  THURSDAY 15 MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM Scooby-Doo! Mystery Incorporated (Season 1 / Ep 6 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

A sleepy little village, Crystal Cove boasts a long history of ghost sightings, poltergeists, 
demon possessions, phantoms and other paranormal occurrences. The renowned 
sleuthing team of Fred, Daphne, Velma, Shaggy and Scooby-Doo prove all of this simply 
isn't real, and along the way, uncover a larger, season-long mystery that will change 
everything. 
 

7.30  Dude, That‘s My Ghost! (Eps 35 – 36 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Dude, That’s My Ghost! follows the adventures of 14-year-old Spencer when he moves to 
Hollywood with  his family and has to adjust to life with his new buddy, the ghost of uber-
famous pop star, Billy Joe Cobra.  
 

8.00  oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 6 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

Justin realizes that it is not all fun being a prefect. He is feeling the heat of prefects’ 
responsibilities and the demands of school work. Together with Sheila the fairy, their 
science project fails to hit the mark and he has to race against time to get it done. 

 

8.30  oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 6 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

Nikki demonstrates what a blender can do to your toys and your fingers! Aiken shows us 
the wrong way to do laundry. Mr Know It All eats too fast.  

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 

okto THURSDAY 15 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM           DOCUMENTARY: Wild Case Files: Bird - Eating Catfish (Ep 6 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

In a Spanish city, pigeons are attacked and killed by a mysterious river-dwelling monster. 
In the Australian outback, kangaroos are suddenly going blind. In the Gulf of Mexico, some 
of the world’s most endangered sea turtles begin washing up dead just weeks after one of 
the worst oil spills in U.S. history. 

 
10.00  a-ok: Island Feast With Peter Kuruvita (Ep 7 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

This series takes Australian chef Peter Kuruvita into some of the world’s most fascinating 
island communities, where he discovers the vibrant intricacies of island life and the 
tradition, passion and flair behind local cuisines. 
 

10.30  a-ok: Luke Nguyen’s Greater Mekong Part 1 (Ep 7 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

Luke hikes to the hill tribe villages of the Shan State and the township of Keng Tung, 
where he cooks some unusual delicacies and local marketplace favourites. 
 

11.00   a-ok: Lost Continent Of The Pacific (Info-ed) (益智节目)    

During the Age of Discovery, explorers searched the Pacific in vain for a mysterious land. 
To this day, the elders on Easter Island claim their ancestors came from a continent called 
Hiva, believed to have sunk after a great disaster. Now, new scientific evidence points to a 
remote island chain in Polynesia as the centre of an ancient, thriving civilization. 
 

12.00MN         Close 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 



 
 
MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
Daily Programme Listing 
 

okto  FRIDAY 16 MAY 2014 
 

9.00AM         Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 5 - 6 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

  
 
9.30   Ella The Elephant (Sr 1 / Ep 2 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Sweet and charming, generous and kind, Ella is one little elephant that stands out in a 
crowd. Perhaps it's her bright red hat? Or maybe it's the fact that she's so good at helping 
others. With her buddies Belinda Blue, Frankie and Lola the Monkey, laughter and 
adventure go hand in hand. 

 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 9 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 4 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

11.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 7 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 28 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 12 / Eps 19 - 20 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 

 

 



 
 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 13 - 14 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get the 
answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches of outer 
space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - and the top - of 
the question. 

 
 

1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 9 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 
 

 

okto  FRIDAY 16 MAY 2014 
 
1.30PM Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 4 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 7 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 28 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Nick Of Time (Eps 5 - 6 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 

A fun adventure drama series, Nick of Time is about improving our way of life, conserving 
nature and how we all have a part to play to make a better future for everyone. 

 
4.00  oktOriginal: Little Great Givers (Eps 5 - 6 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

“Little Great Givers” reveals another face of young Singaporeans - socially conscious and 
responsible individuals who go beyond their means to help others. 

 

5.00 oktOriginal: The Badge (Ep 7 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

“The Badge” is a science show that combines passion and compassion.  Each episode will 
feature a team of young inventors, also known as ‘Scientific Social Workers’, working to 
conceptualize and build a Great Invention to solve the real-life problems of different 
profiles.  

 

 
 
 
 
 



 

5.30  Super Yoyo (Ep 7 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Shunichi Domoto is a talented sportie 5th grade boy who used to help sport teams in his 
school. He enters a Yoyo duel against a bully boy called Benkei to help his friend, Beso, to 
get back his Yoyo and won the yoyo battle. However, he meets the exceptionally gifted 
Yoyo-er, Seito Hojoin who beat him because he ridiculed Yoyo game .So, Shunichi enters 
the Japan`s Yoyo championship to get his revenge with Seito.  

 

6.00  oktOriginal: KNOCKOUT (Sr 7 / Ep 7 / Local Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

This week, it gets heated with melted crayon art, fun-tastic school events, one hit wonders, 
a twirly line-up of arts treats and a one of kind Rondalla challenge. It’s art, art  and more 
art, only on KNOCKOUT: CARNIVAL! 

 
 
 

6.30      Johnny Test (Sr 6 / Ep 11 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

New season of Johnny Test and his dog Dukey wacky adventures! 
 

7.00  Ooglies (Ep 8 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

A quirky and wacky series of shorts featuring vegetables and household objects brought to 
stop-motion, animated life! 

  

7.15   Great Eastern YEO’s S.League 2014: Tanjong Pagar VS Harimau Muda (Sports / 
LIVE)  

 
 
 
 
okto  FRIDAY 16 MAY 2014 
 
9.30PM          ANIMAL NIGHT: Nature’s Microworlds (Ep 12 / Info-ed) (With Chinese Subtitles)  

(益智节目)  

Nature’s Microworlds takes viewers on a fascinating journey, offering a definitive guide to 
some very special places on Earth. 

 

10.00 a-ok: Sherlock (Sr 2 / Ep 3 / Drama) (电视剧)  

James Moriarty possesses the greatest criminal mind that the world has ever seen. 
Sherlock and John knew he wouldn't stay hidden for long. But even they never guessed 
the sheer scale and audacity of the crime that would propel Moriarty back into the 
headlines. 
 

12.00MN        Close 
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okto  SATURDAY 17 MAY 2014 
 

 

7.00AM           oktOriginal: Zoom, Zim, Zam (Eps 13 - 14 / Local Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

“Zoom Zim Zam” is a, phonics based educational pre-school series.  The series features 
Zoomba, Zimba and Zamba literacy superheroes. Who together with their friends learn 
about the world around them and the sounds that alphabets make. The series will feature 
original songs and Dance as part of the programme. 
 

8.00           Sesame Street (Season 40 / Ep 2 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

The beloved Sesame Street gang return in a refreshed show format, complete with new 
guest stars, and a brand new opening theme song! 

 

9.00  My Little Pony: Friendship Is Magic (Season 2 / Ep 15 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片)  

More magical adventures in Equestria and Ponyville, with Twilight Sparkle and her best 
pony gal friends not forgetting Spike, of course! 
 

9.30  Winx Club (Sr 4 / Ep 2 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片)  

This season delivers an enthralling and intense story plot but with a stronger dose of 
comedy than previously.  At Alphea college the new school year is about to begin, 
however the pleasant atmosphere is ruined by the Fairy Hunters who attack the school 
and defeat the Winx.  The Winx decide to go to Earth to Save the Last Fairy. 
 

10.00  Pokemon: BW Adventures In Unova And Beyond (Sr 16 / Ep 20 / Schoolkids / Cartoon)  

(卡通片)  

Team Plasma is determined to execute its evil plans, but our heroes and N have other 
ideas! 
 

10.30  Planet Sheen (Season 1 / Ep 8 / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片) 

After sneaking into his best friend Jimmy Neutron's laboratory, Sheen accidentally blasts 
himself into outer space in Jimmy's top-secret rocketship! Sheen crash-lands on Planet 
Zeenu and ends up having crazy adventures with the Zeenuians while trying to survive the 
evil plots of Dorkus. 

 

11.00  Little Battlers eXperience (Sr 2 / Ep 23 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

This is the story about two main heroes who love LBX and defend the world from tyranny 
with nothing but their LBX! 
 

11.30  Power Rangers Mega Force (Ep 8 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Five teenagers with talent and attitude to form the ultimate team...the Power Rangers 
Megaforce! Using their new found special abilities, mega-weapons, high-tech Zords and 
giant Megazords to battle this new alien threat. 
 

 
 
 
 



12.00NN oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 7 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids) (益智节目)   

A school bully is at large! He is big and mean. All the Primary 3 prefects fall victims to the 
bully’s antics. They vow revenge with their magical abilities but discover a different side to 
the bully. 

 
 
 
 
 

okto  SATURDAY 17 MAY 2014 
 

12.30PM       oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 7 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids) (益智节目)   

Nikki proves that sunscreen can protect us from the sun. Aiken runs for shelter to escape 
lightning. Mr Know It All reminds us why we should never stand under trees during a 
lightning storm.  

  
1.00  Adventurers Masters Of Time (Eps 13 - 14 / Schoolkids / R)  

Four school friends are suddenly whisked back through the ages on a desperate search 
for their missing computer professor - by uploading themselves by way of a time 
continuum software! Unfortunately they haven't made the journey alone. An evil hacker is 
threatening to change world history. 

 
2.00  Kaijudo (Eps 11 - 12 / Schoolkids / R)  

Ray, a 14-year-old who lives with his mom and granddad, has been recruited by the Duel 
Masters to study Kaijudo: The Way of the Creature. They chose Ray for his natural talent 
as a creature tamer and duelist. 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Zero Hero (Eps 1 - 2 / Local Drama / R) (电视剧)  

Zero Hero is a series revolving around a Singaporean superhero family, The Magnificent 
Heroes, who have mysteriously lost all their super powers and now struggle to be like the 
average human being. Every week, a super villain from their past resurfaces, and it’s up to 
our superheroes with no super powers to foil them. 

 
4.02 oktOriginal: The Mad Science Manual (Eps 11 - 12 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R)  

(益智节目) 

Science is mad…fun! Or at least it is when you know how. A series of sixteen episodes 
that inspire home made scientific experiments that send the imagination racing, all the 
while encouraging kids - and the occasional adult - to ask 'WHY?'  

 
5.00 Edebits (Eps 23 – 24 / Schoolkids / Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

  Edebits is the ecological series of the moment! Guided by Bet and her inseparable friends, 
the edebits, boys and girls will learn and discover about issues such as environmental 
awareness or climate change.  

   

5.30 Wendy (Ep 6 / Cartoon / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 

The show charts the adventures of teenage heroine, Wendy and focuses on her equestrian 
centered life. Living on a stud-farm, complete with a riding school and stables, Wendy has 
become an accomplished rider and show jumper; her life is full of gossip, friendships and 
romances. 

   
 



6.00  Martha Speaks Part 2 (Ep 17 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

New episodes about Martha, a beloved family dog who is accidentally fed alphabet soup, 
giving her the power of speech and the chance to speak her mind to anyone to anyone 
that will listen, often with hilarious consequences!  

 

6.30  Oscar’s Oasis (Ep 21 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Hilarious 3D animated, non-dialogue series in the style of Looney Tunes. Oscar, the lonely 
desert lizard, battles the rigeurs of the desert as well as his un-neighbourly fellow 
inhabitants, from chickens to mischievous meerkats. 

 
 
 
 

okto  SATURDAY 18 MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM     Pokemon: Black & White (Season 15 / Ep 29 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

The continuing adventures of Ash Ketchum and Pikachu as they continue traveling though 
Unova with friends Cilan and Iris, to take on his remaining five gym badges. 

 

7.30  ThunderCats (Ep 13 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

THUNDERCATS presents the grand origin story of Prince Lion-O's ascension to the 
throne and those who would thwart his destiny at any cost and takes on epic dimensions 
in this sharp new telling. 
 

8.00  Mudpit (Ep 22 / Schoolkids / R)  
You ready to ROCK?! You ready to LAUGH?! Then you're ready for... MUDPIT! A live-
action/animated comedy series about four teens that form a virtual rock band in hopes of 
becoming real rock stars! 

 

8.30  Fort Boyard Ultimate Challenge (Srs 1 & 2 / Ep 4 / Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Fort Boyard - Ultimate Challenge is the ultimate adventure series where 24 teens from the 
United States and the United Kingdom compete as teams in a series of exciting 
challenges designed to test their brainpower, courage and teamwork! 
 
 
 

 

okto  SATURDAY 17 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM oktoLIFE: The Drinker’s Dilemma (Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Filmed by award-winning cameraman Dr Rudolf Lammers, this documentary provides 
stunning images of a wide range of characters, not just the big impressive lion, elephant 
and zebra but also the doves and jackals at their feet, all part of the same great circle of 
life. 

 
10.00  CENTRESTAGE: SSO: Mahler’s Symphony Of A Thousand (Culture)  

Conducted by Lan Shui, the Singapore Symphony Orchestra plays Mahler’s Symphony of 
a Thousand. 

 
12.00MN       Close 
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okto SUNDAY 18 MAY 2014 
 

 

7.00AM           oktOriginal: Club M.A.G.I.C (Eps 13 – 14 / Local Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

CLUB M.A.G.I.C was developed to enrich the learning experience of preschoolers by 
creating a purposeful teaching environment that nurtures their holistic development. The 
series celebrates the joy of learning while encouraging children to adopt a positive, can-do 
attitude whenever they embark on a task.  

 

8.00           LazyTown (Season 1 / Eps 32 – 33 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
In LazyTown, Stephanie and Sportacus are always trying to helps the kids to live active lifestyles, 
while thwarting the schemes of the world’s laziest super-villain, Robbie Rotten! A funny, fresh show. 

 

9.00 Stuart Little: The Animated Series (Ep 5 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
Everyones favorite Little guy returns in this fun-filled animated adventure series.  Whether he’s 
exploring the great outdoors, skate boarding with his brother George or in pursuit of Taco Tuesday, 

Stuart Little brings his trademark heart and humor sure to delight the whole family. 
 

9.32 The Adventures Of Tintin (Ep 31 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) (PG) 

The original TinTin animated series featuring the classic adventures of the globetrotting 
young journalist, TinTin, and his dog, Snowy. 
 

10.00  Buddy Fight (Ep 16 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Trading card based Japanese anime series. Children form a contract with creatures, also 
known as their buddy, and fight as a tag team combination. 

 

10.30  Cardfight Vanguard (Sr 3 / Ep 32 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Exciting 3rd season of Cardfight Vanguard. 
 

11.00  Little Battlers eXperience (Sr 2 / Ep 24 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

This is the story about two main heroes who love LBX and defend the world from tyranny 
with nothing but their LBX! 

 

11.30  Jackie Chan Adventures (Season 3 / Ep 14 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
Jackie Chan teams up in this anime-style animated adventure with his 11-year-old niece, Jade, 

traveling the globe to locate a dozen magical talismans before the sinister Dark Hand does. 

 
12.00NN Robotboy (Season 2 / Eps 13 - 14 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Created by world-renowned scientist Professor Moshimo, Robotboy attracts the diabolical 
attention of supervillains intent on harnessing Robotboy's powers to enslave the world. So 
Moshimo sends Robotboy far away to live with his number one fan, Tommy. 

 
12.30PM Geronimo Stilton (Ep 7 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Geronimo Stilton is an exciting animated adventure-comedy series that follows the adventures of 
the famous - Geronimo Stilton – erudite mouse, head of a veritable media empire and klutz 
extraordinaire and Benjamin Stilton his fearless and smart 12 year old nephew.   



 

1.00  The Ugly Duckling & Me (Ep 2 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 
We are all familiar with Hans Christian Andersen's tale of the ugly duckling who became a swan. 
But what a lot of people don't know is that, along the way, the same duckling was adopted by 
Ratso, a city rat hiding out in a duckyard full of farm animals! 

 

 
 
okto SUNDAY 18 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM The Adventures Of Paddington Bear (Ep 19 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Follow the adventures of the well-loved classic bear. 
 

2.00 Dirt Girl World (Eps 23 - 24 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Uniquely animated series with an environmental focus, e.g. exploring recycling and 
growing your own vegetables. 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: My Classmate Dad (Sr 2 / Eps 3 – 4 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 
This season brings about a body switch adventure with a whole new twist!  Uncle Adyson and 
nephew Chee Meng are still stuck in each other’s body as a result of a literally electrifying and 
mysterious pendant, and the hunt continues for an end to their unfortunate plight. 

 

4.00  oktOriginal: Team Word (Eps 1 – 2 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Scrumble, Fumble and Tumble your way in this word game show that not only tests your 
spelling abilities, but your speed, agility and teamwork skills as well!  Each week, two 
teams pit against each other using big letter tiles in three different challenges.   

 

5.00 Oscar The Balloonist (Eps 15 – 16 / Cartoon / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片)  

Join the exiting adventures of eight-year-old Oscar, who travels the world in his hot air 
balloon together with his trusted companion, Spike the Cactus!  
 

5.30 Wendy (Ep 7 / Cartoon / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 
The show charts the adventures of teenage heroine, Wendy and focuses on her equestrian 
centered life. Living on a stud-farm, complete with a riding school and stables, Wendy has become 
an accomplished rider and show jumper; her life is full of gossip, friendships and romances. 

 

6.00  Martha Speaks Part 2 (Ep 18 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

New episodes about Martha, a beloved family dog who is accidentally fed alphabet soup, 
giving her the power of speech and the chance to speak her mind to anyone to anyone 
that will listen, often with hilarious consequences!  
 

6.30 Oscar’s Oasis (Ep 22 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Hilarious 3D animated, non-dialogue series in the style of Looney Tunes. Oscar, the lonely 
desert lizard, battles the rigeurs of the desert as well as his un-neighbourly fellow 
inhabitants, from chickens to mischievous meerkats. 

 

7.00      Pokemon: Black & White (Season 15 / Ep 30 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

The continuing adventures of Ash Ketchum and Pikachu as they continue traveling though 
Unova with friends Cilan and Iris, to take on his remaining five gym badges. 

 
 
 



7.30  ThunderCats (Ep 14 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

THUNDERCATS presents the grand origin story of Prince Lion-O's ascension to the 
throne and those who would thwart his destiny at any cost and takes on epic dimensions 
in this sharp new telling. 

 
8.00  Mudpit (Ep 23 / Schoolkids / R)  

You ready to ROCK?! You ready to LAUGH?! Then you're ready for... MUDPIT! A live-
action/animated comedy series about four teens that form a virtual rock band in hopes of 
becoming real rock stars! 
 

8.30  The S.League Show (Ep 12 / Local Sports)  
All the goals and best action from another week of the S.League rolled into one show. The best 
football clubs in Singapore battle it out to be crowned S.League champions at the end of the 
season. 

 
 
 

okto SUNDAY 18 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM          Doctor Who (Sr 7 / Ep 9 / Drama) (电视剧)  

The Doctor and Clara Oswald visit a mansion in the 1970s owned by Professor Alec 
Palmer, which appears to be haunted. Palmer's assistant, Emma Grayling, is an empath 
who is able to connect to the “ghost”. The Doctor discovers that the “ghost” is really a time 
traveller from the future who is trapped in a pocket universe. 
 

10.00  FILMART: The Message (Mandarin Movie With English Subtitles) (艺 术 影 院)  

1942, Nanjing (Nanking). following a series of assassination attempts on officials of the 
Japanese-controlled puppet government, the Japanese spy chief gathers a group of 
suspects in a mansion house for questioning. A tense game of "cat and mouse" ensues as 
the Chinese code-breaker attempts to send out a crucial message while protecting his/her 
own identity.  
 

12.00MN         Close  
 
 
 
  
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
Daily Programme Listing 
 

okto MONDAY 19 MAY 2014 
 

9.00AM         Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 7 - 8 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

 

9.30   Ella The Elephant (Sr 1 / Ep 3 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Sweet and charming, generous and kind, Ella is one little elephant that stands out in a 
crowd. Perhaps it's her bright red hat? Or maybe it's the fact that she's so good at helping 
others. With her buddies Belinda Blue, Frankie and Lola the Monkey, laughter and 
adventure go hand in hand. 

 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 10 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 5 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

11.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 8 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  
Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of learning 
themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as they learn to 
navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 29 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 17 / Eps 1 - 2 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an enhanced 
look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the adventures of a 
cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life lessons.  

 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 15 - 16 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get the 
answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches of outer 
space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - and the top - of 
the question. 

 

 
 
 
 



1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 10 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
okto MONDAY 19 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 5 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 8 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  
Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of learning 
themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as they learn to 
navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 29 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Zero Hero (Eps 3 - 4 / Local Drama / R) (电视剧)  

Zero Hero is a series revolving around a Singaporean superhero family, The Magnificent 
Heroes, who have mysteriously lost all their super powers and now struggle to be like the 
average human being. Every week, a super villain from their past resurfaces, and it’s up to 
our superheroes with no super powers to foil them. 

 
4.00  oktOriginal: The Mad Science Manual (Eps 13 - 14 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R)  

(益智节目) 

Science is mad…fun! Or at least it is when you know how. A series of sixteen episodes 
that inspire home made scientific experiments that send the imagination racing, all the 
while encouraging kids - and the occasional adult - to ask 'WHY?'  

 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 29 - 30 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they travel 
around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is BYRD a 
handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" floating through time 
and space. 

 
5.30  Secret Kid Venture Club (Ep 2 / Schoolkids)  

The Secret KidVenture Club empowers kids by helping them understand the world they 
live in, teaching them about the impact their decisions have on their own liveseven when 
they are 8 years old! Its not about understanding a Balance Sheet but rather about the 
value of ones reputation. 

 

6.00  oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 7 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

A school bully is at large! He is big and mean. All the Primary 3 prefects fall victims to the 
bully’s antics. They vow revenge with their magical abilities but discover a different side to 
the bully. 

 

 
 



 
6.30     okto @ The Movies: Open Season 2 (Movie / Schoolkids)  

After falling head over hooves in love with Giselle, Elliot's road to the altar takes a 
slight detour when Mr. Weenie is kidnapped by a group of pampered pets 
determined to return him to his owners. 
 

8.30 Tricky TV (Sr 3 / Ep 19 / Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

In this season, host & magician Stephen Mulhern returns with a talented cast of young 
trickers to boogle the brains of the viewing public with amazing magic and stunts. 
 

 
 
okto MONDAY 19 MAY 2014 
 
9.00PM           ANIMAL NIGHT: Built For The Kill: Polar Bear (Season 4 / Ep 2 / Info-ed)  

(With Chinese Subtitles) (益智节目)  

This episode shows, in dramatic detail, how the polar bear – the world’s largest land 
predator  develops skills needed to hunt and kill its prey in the harsh Arctic environment. 

 
10.00  a-ok: Antiques Road Trip (Sr 7 / Ep 6 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Antiques experts Anita Manning and James Lewis seek out bargains they hope will make 
a profit at auction. The items they buy in this episode include a 1883 oar, a Japanese 
brush pot, a silver pink cushion, a pretty landscape in oils, and a small 19th-century 
bronze figure of St Peter. 
 

11.00   a-ok: Arts.21 (Ep 142 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

On this edition of Arts.21: now that Cornelius Gurlitt has died, who are the rightful owners 
of his Nazi-era art hoard? Anne Frank’s diaries brought to life on the stage; the winners of 
this year’s CIVIS diversity awards; and why Munich is booming as a theater city.  
 

11.30   a-ok: Euromaxx (Ep 142 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

Topics include this year’s Eurovision Song Contest, an exhitibion of paper cutouts by Henri 
Matisse, and the works of French floral designer Thierry Boutemy. 

 
12.00MN         Close 

 
 
 
 



MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
Daily Programme Listing 
 

okto TUESDAY 20 MAY 2014 
 

9.00AM           Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 9 - 10 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

 

9.30   Ella The Elephant (Sr 1 / Ep 4 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Sweet and charming, generous and kind, Ella is one little elephant that stands out in a 
crowd. Perhaps it's her bright red hat? Or maybe it's the fact that she's so good at helping 
others. With her buddies Belinda Blue, Frankie and Lola the Monkey, laughter and 
adventure go hand in hand. 

 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 11 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every episode, 
our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a mission with a 
specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic ROCKET, and together 
they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 

10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 6 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

11.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 9 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  
Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of learning 
themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as they learn to 
navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 30 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 17 / Eps 3 - 4 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 
 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 17 - 18 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get 
the answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches 
of outer space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - 
and the top - of the question. 

 

1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 11 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every episode, 
our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a mission with a 
specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic ROCKET, and together 
they blast off on "the mission of the day". 



 
 
 
 
 
 

okto TUESDAY 20 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 6 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 
2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 9 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 
2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 30 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
3.00 oktOriginal: oktOriginal: My Classmate Dad (Sr 2 / Eps 5 – 6 / Local Drama / Schoolkids 

/ R) (电视剧) 

This season brings about a body switch adventure with a whole new twist!  Uncle Adyson 
and nephew Chee Meng are still stuck in each other’s body as a result of a literally 
electrifying and mysterious pendant, and the hunt continues for an end to their unfortunate 
plight. 
 

4.00  oktOriginal: Team Word (Eps 3 – 4 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Scrumble, Fumble and Tumble your way in this word game show that not only tests your 
spelling abilities, but your speed, agility and teamwork skills as well!  Each week, two 
teams pit against each other using big letter tiles in three different challenges.   

 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 31 - 32 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 
5.30  Secret Kid Venture Club (Ep 3 / Schoolkids)  

The Secret KidVenture Club empowers kids by helping them understand the world they 
live in, teaching them about the impact their decisions have on their own liveseven when 
they are 8 years old! Its not about understanding a Balance Sheet but rather about the 
value of ones reputation. 

 

6.00 oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 7 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)  

Nikki proves that sunscreen can protect us from the sun. Aiken runs for shelter to escape 
lightning. Mr Know It All reminds us why we should never stand under trees during a 
lightning storm.  
 



6.30            SpongeBob SquarePants (Ep 137 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

For the world's favourite sea sponge, SpongeBob, his best friend Patrick, and the other 
residents of the tropical Bikini Bottom, life is a series of nautical and often nonsensical 
adventures. 

 
 
 

okto TUESDAY 20 MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM Scooby-Doo! Mystery Incorporated (Season 1 / Ep 7 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

A sleepy little village, Crystal Cove boasts a long history of ghost sightings, poltergeists, 
demon possessions, phantoms and other paranormal occurrences. The renowned 
sleuthing team of Fred, Daphne, Velma, Shaggy and Scooby-Doo prove all of this simply 
isn't real, and along the way, uncover a larger, season-long mystery that will change 
everything. 

 

7.30  Totally Spies (Sr 6 / Ep 14 / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 

The girls are back to fight more crime for WHOOP! Follow their ongoing journey in the 
exciting and dangerous world of international espionage, all whilst juggling school and 
their studies! 

 
8.00  Just Kidding (Ep 24 / Schoolkids) 

Just Kidding is a prank show hosted by Zach Fox. 
 

8.30  Lab Rats Challenge (Sr 2 / Ep 6 / Schoolkids / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

In every show two teams made up of pairs of friends compete in a range of science based 
challenges. Each team is assigned a host who commentate on what is happening and how 
it works. They talk to team members about their tactics, progress and feelings.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 
 
 
 
 
okto TUESDAY 20 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM          DOCUMENTARY: Food Factory 3 (Eps 13 - 14 / Info-ed) (益智节目) 

From raw materials to finished products, Food Factory goes behind the scenes to reveal 
how some American favourite foods are made. 
 

10.00 a-ok: KNOCKOUT (Sr 7 / Ep 8 / Local Info-ed) (益智节目)  

This week, raise the roof for ventriloquism, antique paintings, the world’s longest novels 
and the art of watercolours in the Painting challenge. Unleash your creativity, only on 
KNOCKOUT: CARNIVAL! 
   

10.30 a-ok: ARTreprenuers (Ep 2 / Local Info-ed / 2nd Telecast) (益智节目)  

“ARTreprenuers is a series that explores the world of art and creative endeavors from the 
one thing all Singaporeans understand best: the economy.  Each episode will feature a 
particular segment of Singapore’s diverse field of arts and creative startups, with a unique 
and sustainable revenue model that hold its own against other brick and mortar 
businesses. 
 

11.00  a-ok: Ade In Britain (Sr 2 / Ep 27 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Adrian Edmondson is off to England’s northernmost county, Northumberland, to search for 
local British foods and traditions.   

 
12.00MN         Close 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 



MediaCorp Pte Ltd 

Daily Programme Listing 
 

okto  WEDNESDAY 21  MAY 2014 
                 

9.00AM           Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 11 - 12 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

 

9.30   Ella The Elephant (Sr 1 / Ep 5 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Sweet and charming, generous and kind, Ella is one little elephant that stands out in a 
crowd. Perhaps it's her bright red hat? Or maybe it's the fact that she's so good at helping 
others. With her buddies Belinda Blue, Frankie and Lola the Monkey, laughter and 
adventure go hand in hand. 

 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 12 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 7 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 
11.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 10 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 31 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 17 / Eps 5 - 6 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 

 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 19 - 20 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get 
the answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches 
of outer space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - 
and the top - of the question. 

 
 
 



1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 12 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
 
 
 

okto  WEDNESDAY 21  MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 7 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

2.00   Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 10 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 31 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
3.00 oktOriginal: R.E.M. – The Next Generation (Sr 2 / Eps 2 – 3 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / 

R) (电视剧) 

Picking up where the first season left off, the sensational second season sees the terrific 
trio of Roxy, Elle and M. diving into the heat of the action!  The question of what happened 
to Roxy's sister Rachel and the original REM is answered while new mysteries unfold. 

 

4.00  oktOriginal: Street Racers (Eps 5 - 6 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Get ready for some high-octane action as we speed through our heritage trails on Street 
Racers! Each week, our guides pair up with 2 contestants each for a Street Racers 
Challenge.  The first team to finish the race will become our Street Racers Champion! 
Willthey have the drive to finish the race? Who will emerge the winner? 
 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 33 - 34 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 
5.30  Secret Kid Venture Club (Ep 4 / Schoolkids)  

The Secret KidVenture Club empowers kids by helping them understand the world they 
live in, teaching them about the impact their decisions have on their own liveseven when 
they are 8 years old! Its not about understanding a Balance Sheet but rather about the 
value of ones reputation. 

 
 
 



 

6.00  Voltron Force (Ep 26 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

The classic Voltron series has been re-made for a new generation! Action-packed and 
gripping animation series. 
 

6.30          SpongeBob SquarePants (Ep 138 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

For the world's favourite sea sponge, SpongeBob, his best friend Patrick, and the other 
residents of the tropical Bikini Bottom, life is a series of nautical and often nonsensical 
adventures. 

 
 
 
 

okto  WEDNESDAY 21  MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM Scooby-Doo! Mystery Incorporated (Season 1 / Ep 8 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

A sleepy little village, Crystal Cove boasts a long history of ghost sightings, poltergeists, 
demon possessions, phantoms and other paranormal occurrences. The renowned 
sleuthing team of Fred, Daphne, Velma, Shaggy and Scooby-Doo prove all of this simply 
isn't real, and along the way, uncover a larger, season-long mystery that will change 
everything. 

 

7.30   Totally Spies (Sr 6 / Ep 15 / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 

The girls are back to fight more crime for WHOOP! Follow their ongoing journey in the 
exciting and dangerous world of international espionage, all whilst juggling school and 
their studies! 

 
8.00  Crash & Bernstein (Yr 1 / Ep 7 / Schoolkids) (PG)  

When Wyatt's intramural basketball coach quits due to Crash's relentless heckling, Crash 
steps in as the new coach in hopes of breaking their losing streak. But after he benches 
Wyatt and hires an NBA player, Crash learns that winning isn't always everything. 
Meanwhile, Cleo agrees to supply Wyatt's team with basketball jerseys and hires Amanda 
to work for her fashion company. 

 

8.30  Kitchen Whiz (Sr 4 / Ep 7 / Info-ed / Schoolkids) (益智节目)   

Kitchen Whiz is a fast, fabulous, food focussed game show for kids. A 4-course menu of 
messy, hands on quick cooking and food competition, keeps contestants on their toes as 
they race around the super stocked Kitchn Whiz Pantry. 2 teams of junior chefs compete 
in fun, messy and tactile tasks. 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
okto WEDNESDAY 21 MAY 2014 
 
9.00PM     ANIMAL NIGHT: Caught In The Act  (Season 4 / Ep 2 / Info-ed) (With Chinese Subtitles)  

(益智节目)  

This documentary gathers rare and amazing wildlife action captured by professional and 
amateur cameramen:  a lone lion takes on an injured buffalo, a hippo attacks a crocodile, a 
porcupine faces off with a leopard, an elephant seal wreaks havoc in a New Zealand town. 
 

10.00   a-ok: City In A Garden (Ep 1 / Debut / Local Info-ed) (益智节目)  

This series will feature four core stories of real people revisiting the past, living their 
present, and envisioning their future. Their rich life experiences, connected in one 
way or another with the Singapore Botanic Gardens, have not only impacted their 
lives, changed their surroundings, but also touched those around them. 

 

10.30   a-ok: My Roots (Ep 1 / Local Info-ed / 2nd Telecast) (益智节目)  

My Roots is a documentary series that intrigues and inspires us to learn more about who 
we are through our genealogy. In each episode, a well-known Singaporean goes on a 
personal journey of self-discovery and surprises, to trace his or her ancestry.   
 

11.00  a-ok: Takeshi Art Beat (Eps 8 - 9 / Info-ed / 2nd Telecast) (益智节目)  

Akio Hirata is a global fashion pioneer in hat design. Takeshi visits Hirata’s studio in the 
Azabu district of Tokyo.  Tomotaka Takahashi is a robot creator whose best-known work is 
the bipedal robot Chroino. Takeshi visits Takahashi’s lab and delves into the secrets of his 
trademark fusion of design and technology. 

 
12.00MN         Close 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 



MediaCorp Pte Ltd 

Daily Programme Listing 
 

okto  THURSDAY 22 MAY 2014 
 

9.00AM           Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 13 – 14 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

 

9.30   Ella The Elephant (Sr 1 / Ep 6 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Sweet and charming, generous and kind, Ella is one little elephant that stands out in a 
crowd. Perhaps it's her bright red hat? Or maybe it's the fact that she's so good at helping 
others. With her buddies Belinda Blue, Frankie and Lola the Monkey, laughter and 
adventure go hand in hand. 

 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 13 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 

10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 8 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

11.00   Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 11 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 32 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 17 / Eps 7 - 8 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 

 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 21 - 22 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get the 
answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches of outer 
space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - and the top - of 
the question. 

 
 
 
 



1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 13 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
 
 
 
 

okto  THURSDAY 22 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 8 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 11 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 32 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Dream School (Eps 7 – 8 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 

A group of kids enrol into a school for the performing arts. This musical drama series is 
about their trials and tribulations as they try to fit into a creative environment to nurture 
their special gifts.  
 

4.00  oktOriginal: Saved Or Slimed (Sr 2 / Eps 7 – 8 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

This season of the zany children’s game show, it is fun-filled, educational and definitely 
wet! The game show challenges the Mental, Physical & Social aspects of the participants.  
Each week sees three schools racing to save their school mate.  
 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 35 - 36 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 
5.30  Secret Kid Venture Club (Ep 5 / Schoolkids)  

The Secret KidVenture Club empowers kids by helping them understand the world they 
live in, teaching them about the impact their decisions have on their own liveseven when 
they are 8 years old! Its not about understanding a Balance Sheet but rather about the 
value of ones reputation. 

 
 
 
 



6.00  Planet Sheen (Season 1 / Ep 8 / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片) 

After sneaking into his best friend Jimmy Neutron's laboratory, Sheen accidentally blasts 
himself into outer space in Jimmy's top-secret rocketship! Sheen crash-lands on Planet 
Zeenu and ends up having crazy adventures with the Zeenuians while trying to survive the 
evil plots of Dorkus. 

 

6.30       Johnny Test (Sr 6 / Ep 12 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

New season of Johnny Test and his dog Dukey wacky adventures! 
 
 
 

okto  THURSDAY 22 MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM Scooby-Doo! Mystery Incorporated (Season 1 / Ep 9 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

A sleepy little village, Crystal Cove boasts a long history of ghost sightings, poltergeists, 
demon possessions, phantoms and other paranormal occurrences. The renowned 
sleuthing team of Fred, Daphne, Velma, Shaggy and Scooby-Doo prove all of this simply 
isn't real, and along the way, uncover a larger, season-long mystery that will change 
everything. 
 

7.30  Dude, That‘s My Ghost! (Eps 37 – 38 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Dude, That’s My Ghost! follows the adventures of 14-year-old Spencer when he moves to 
Hollywood with  his family and has to adjust to life with his new buddy, the ghost of uber-
famous pop star, Billy Joe Cobra.  
 

8.00  oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 7 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

A school bully is at large! He is big and mean. All the Primary 3 prefects fall victims to the 
bully’s antics. They vow revenge with their magical abilities but discover a different side to 
the bully. 
 

8.30  oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 7 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

Nikki proves that sunscreen can protect us from the sun. Aiken runs for shelter to escape 
lightning. Mr Know It All reminds us why we should never stand under trees during a 
lightning storm.  

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



okto THURSDAY 22 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM           DOCUMENTARY: Seconds From Diaster: Pearl Harbour (Sr 4 / Ep 1 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Japan made a pre-emptive and surprise attack on Pearl Harbour in 1941 during World 
War II. By examining events leading up to the attack and analyzing previously classified 
military records, this programme reveals why the raid turned out to a total disaster for the 
empire of Japan. 
 

10.00  a-ok: Island Feast With Peter Kuruvita (Ep 8 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

This series takes Australian chef Peter Kuruvita into some of the world’s most fascinating 
island communities, where he discovers the vibrant intricacies of island life and the 
tradition, passion and flair behind local cuisines. 
 

10.30  a-ok: Luke Nguyen’s Greater Mekong Part 1 (Ep 8 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

Luke makes it to the town of Chiang Khong in northern Thailand, where he literally catches 
the ingredients for his traditional Tom Yum fish soup and tasty northern-style frog curry. 
 

11.00   a-ok: Treasures Of Ancient Egypt (Ep 1 / Debut / Info-ed) (益智节目)    

Art critic Alastair Sooke tells the story of ancient Egyptian art through 30 
extraordinary masterpieces. Tracing the origins of Egypt's unique visual style, he 
treks across the Sahara and travels the Nile to find the rarely-seen art of its earliest 
peoples.  
 

12.00MN         Close 
 
 
 
 
 

MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
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okto  FRIDAY 23 MAY 2014 
 
9.00AM          Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 15 - 16 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

 
9.30   Ella The Elephant (Sr 1 / Ep 7 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Sweet and charming, generous and kind, Ella is one little elephant that stands out in a 
crowd. Perhaps it's her bright red hat? Or maybe it's the fact that she's so good at helping 
others. With her buddies Belinda Blue, Frankie and Lola the Monkey, laughter and 
adventure go hand in hand. 

 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 14 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 



10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 9 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

11.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 12 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 33 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 17 / Eps 9 - 10 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 

 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 23 - 24 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get the 
answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches of outer 
space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - and the top - of 
the question. 

 

1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 14 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 
 

 
okto  FRIDAY 23 MAY 2014 
 
1.30PM Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 9 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 12 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 33 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

 



 

3.00  oktOriginal: Nick Of Time (Eps 7 - 8 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 

A fun adventure drama series, Nick of Time is about improving our way of life, conserving 
nature and how we all have a part to play to make a better future for everyone. 

 
4.00 oktOriginal: World Class (Eps 1 - 2 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

“World Class” is a documentary, part drama where students from all over the world get to 
see, learn and experience about each other’s culture and background in a light-hearted 
and fun way!  

 
5.00 oktOriginal: The Badge (Ep 8 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

“The Badge” is a science show that combines passion and compassion.  Each episode will 
feature a team of young inventors, also known as ‘Scientific Social Workers’, working to 
conceptualize and build a Great Invention to solve the real-life problems of different 
profiles.  

 

5.30  Super Yoyo (Ep 8 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Shunichi Domoto is a talented sportie 5th grade boy who used to help sport teams in his 
school. He enters a Yoyo duel against a bully boy called Benkei to help his friend, Beso, to 
get back his Yoyo and won the yoyo battle. However, he meets the exceptionally gifted 
Yoyo-er, Seito Hojoin who beat him because he ridiculed Yoyo game .So, Shunichi enters 
the Japan`s Yoyo championship to get his revenge with Seito.  

 

6.00  oktOriginal: KNOCKOUT (Sr 7 / Ep 8 / Local Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

This week, raise the roof for ventriloquism, antique paintings, the world’s longest novels 
and the art of watercolours in the Painting challenge. Unleash your creativity, only on 
KNOCKOUT: CARNIVAL! 

 

6.30      Johnny Test (Sr 6 / Ep 13 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

New season of Johnny Test and his dog Dukey wacky adventures! 
 

7.00  Ooglies (Ep 9 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

A quirky and wacky series of shorts featuring vegetables and household objects brought to 
stop-motion, animated life! 

  

7.15   Great Eastern YEO’s S.League 2014: Courts Young Lions VS Tampines Rovers 
(Sports / Local / LIVE)  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



okto  FRIDAY 23 MAY 2014 
 
9.30PM          ANIMAL NIGHT: Nature’s Microworlds (Ep 13 / Info-ed) (With Chinese Subtitles)  

(益智节目)  

Nature’s Microworlds takes viewers on a fascinating journey, offering a definitive guide to 
some very special places on Earth. 

 

10.00 a-ok: Murdoch Mysteries (Sr 5 / Ep 1 / Drama) (电视剧)  

Detective William Murdoch leaves Toronto for the Klondike Gold Rush, intent on a life 
beyond policing. While there he stumbles upon a murder investigation and soon realizes 
his days as a detective are not yet behind him.  

 

11.00 a-ok: Ben Hur (Ep 1 / Debut / Drama) (电视剧)  

Judah Ben Hur and Messala are best friends, growing up together in Jerusalem 
which is under Roman occupation. After eight years away from Jerusalem, Messala 
returns as the new commander of the Roman garrison. The two old friends come to 
realize that they have changed and hold different views and aspirations. During a 
military parade a roof tile falls down from Judah's house and injures the Roman 
governor. Messala condemns Judah to the galleys and throws his mother and sister 
into prison. 
 

12.00MN        Close 
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okto  SATURDAY 24 MAY 2014 
 

7.00AM           oktOriginal: Zoom, Zim, Zam (Eps 15 - 16 / Local Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

“Zoom Zim Zam” is a, phonics based educational pre-school series.  The series features 
Zoomba, Zimba and Zamba literacy superheroes. Who together with their friends learn 
about the world around them and the sounds that alphabets make. The series will feature 
original songs and Dance as part of the programme. 
 

8.00           Sesame Street (Season 40 / Ep 3 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

The beloved Sesame Street gang return in a refreshed show format, complete with new 
guest stars, and a brand new opening theme song! 

 

9.00  My Little Pony: Friendship Is Magic (Season 2 / Ep 16 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片)  

More magical adventures in Equestria and Ponyville, with Twilight Sparkle and her best 
pony gal friends not forgetting Spike, of course! 
 

 
 
 



9.30  Winx Club (Sr 4 / Ep 3 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片)  

This season delivers an enthralling and intense story plot but with a stronger dose of 
comedy than previously.  At Alphea college the new school year is about to begin, 
however the pleasant atmosphere is ruined by the Fairy Hunters who attack the school 
and defeat the Winx.  The Winx decide to go to Earth to Save the Last Fairy. 
 

10.00  Pokemon: BW Adventures In Unova And Beyond (Sr 16 / Ep 21 / Schoolkids / Cartoon)  

(卡通片)  

As our heroes continue their journey to the White Ruins, they learn startling secrets about 
N and Team Plasma! 
 

10.30  Planet Sheen (Season 1 / Ep 9 / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片) 

After sneaking into his best friend Jimmy Neutron's laboratory, Sheen accidentally blasts 
himself into outer space in Jimmy's top-secret rocketship! Sheen crash-lands on Planet 
Zeenu and ends up having crazy adventures with the Zeenuians while trying to survive the 
evil plots of Dorkus. 

 

11.00  Little Battlers eXperience (Sr 2 / Ep 25 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

This is the story about two main heroes who love LBX and defend the world from tyranny 
with nothing but their LBX! 
 

11.30  Power Rangers Mega Force (Ep 9 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Five teenagers with talent and attitude to form the ultimate team...the Power Rangers 
Megaforce! Using their new found special abilities, mega-weapons, high-tech Zords and 
giant Megazords to battle this new alien threat. 
 

12.00NN oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 8 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids) (益智节目)   

The Primary 3 prefects use their magical abilities to help a friend in need. They finally 
come to terms with their special powers in a mostly human world. Little do they know that 
all along, another magical being has been watching them! 
 

 
 
 
 
 

okto  SATURDAY 24 MAY 2014 
 

12.30PM       oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 8 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids) (益智节目)   

With the help of Killah Litta-man, Nikki shows us the danger of running with scissors. Aiken 
sits way too close to the TV and suffers the worse for it. Mr Know It All plays on an 
escalator and is squished.  
  

1.00  Adventurers Masters Of Time (Eps 15 - 16 / Schoolkids / R)  
Four school friends are suddenly whisked back through the ages on a desperate search 
for their missing computer professor - by uploading themselves by way of a time 
continuum software! Unfortunately they haven't made the journey alone. An evil hacker is 
threatening to change world history. 

 
 
 
 



2.00  Kaijudo (Eps 13 - 14 / Schoolkids / R)  
Ray, a 14-year-old who lives with his mom and granddad, has been recruited by the Duel 
Masters to study Kaijudo: The Way of the Creature. They chose Ray for his natural talent 
as a creature tamer and duelist. 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Zero Hero (Eps 3 - 4 / Local Drama / R) (电视剧)  

Zero Hero is a series revolving around a Singaporean superhero family, The Magnificent 
Heroes, who have mysteriously lost all their super powers and now struggle to be like the 
average human being. Every week, a super villain from their past resurfaces, and it’s up to 
our superheroes with no super powers to foil them. 

 
4.00  oktOriginal: The Mad Science Manual (Eps 13 - 14 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R)  

(益智节目) 

Science is mad…fun! Or at least it is when you know how. A series of sixteen episodes 
that inspire home made scientific experiments that send the imagination racing, all the 
while encouraging kids - and the occasional adult - to ask 'WHY?'  

 
5.00 Edebits (Eps 25 – 26 / Schoolkids / Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

  Edebits is the ecological series of the moment! Guided by Bet and her inseparable friends, 
the edebits, boys and girls will learn and discover about issues such as environmental 
awareness or climate change.  

   

5.30 Wendy (Ep 8 / Cartoon / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 

The show charts the adventures of teenage heroine, Wendy and focuses on her equestrian 
centered life. Living on a stud-farm, complete with a riding school and stables, Wendy has 
become an accomplished rider and show jumper; her life is full of gossip, friendships and 
romances. 

   

6.00  Martha Speaks Part 2 (Ep 19 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

New episodes about Martha, a beloved family dog who is accidentally fed alphabet soup, 
giving her the power of speech and the chance to speak her mind to anyone to anyone 
that will listen, often with hilarious consequences!  

 

6.30  Oscar’s Oasis (Ep 23 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Hilarious 3D animated, non-dialogue series in the style of Looney Tunes. Oscar, the lonely 
desert lizard, battles the rigeurs of the desert as well as his un-neighbourly fellow 
inhabitants, from chickens to mischievous meerkats. 

 
 
 
 
 

okto  SATURDAY 24 MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM     Pokemon: Black & White (Season 15 / Ep 31 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

The continuing adventures of Ash Ketchum and Pikachu as they continue traveling though 
Unova with friends Cilan and Iris, to take on his remaining five gym badges. 

 

7.30  ThunderCats (Ep 15 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

THUNDERCATS presents the grand origin story of Prince Lion-O's ascension to the 
throne and those who would thwart his destiny at any cost and takes on epic dimensions 
in this sharp new telling. 



 
8.00  Mudpit (Ep 24 / Schoolkids / R)  

You ready to ROCK?! You ready to LAUGH?! Then you're ready for... MUDPIT! A live-
action/animated comedy series about four teens that form a virtual rock band in hopes of 
becoming real rock stars! 

 

8.30  Fort Boyard Ultimate Challenge (Srs 1 & 2 / Ep 5 / Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Fort Boyard - Ultimate Challenge is the ultimate adventure series where 24 teens from the 
United States and the United Kingdom compete as teams in a series of exciting 
challenges designed to test their brainpower, courage and teamwork! 
 
 

 
 

okto  SATURDAY 24 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM oktoLIFE: Animal's World II (Ep 1 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

This documentary series brings an extraordinary new perspective to the enduring 
fascination of some of nature's most intriguing creatures. Lions, elephants and 
chimpanzees are featured in the show's second season, as intimate portraits help 
viewers understand how these members of the animal kingdom perceive their world. 

 
10.00  CENTRESTAGE: Berliner Philharmoniker & Claudio Abbado: Tribute To Gustav Mahler  
  (Culture)  

Conducted by Claudio Abbado, the Berliner Philharmoniker plays Gustav Mahler’s 
Symphony 10 and “Das Lied von der Erde”.    

 
 
12.00MN       Close 
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okto SUNDAY 25 MAY 2014 
 

7.00AM           oktOriginal: Club M.A.G.I.C (Eps 15 – 16 / Local Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

CLUB M.A.G.I.C was developed to enrich the learning experience of preschoolers by 
creating a purposeful teaching environment that nurtures their holistic development. The 
series celebrates the joy of learning while encouraging children to adopt a positive, can-do 
attitude whenever they embark on a task.  

 

8.00           LazyTown (Season 1 / Eps 34 – 35 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
In LazyTown, Stephanie and Sportacus are always trying to helps the kids to live active lifestyles, 
while thwarting the schemes of the world’s laziest super-villain, Robbie Rotten! A funny, fresh show. 

 



 
 

9.00 Stuart Little: The Animated Series (Ep 6 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
Everyones favorite Little guy returns in this fun-filled animated adventure series.  Whether he’s 
exploring the great outdoors, skate boarding with his brother George or in pursuit of Taco Tuesday, 

Stuart Little brings his trademark heart and humor sure to delight the whole family. 
 

 The Adventures Of Tintin (Ep 32 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) (PG) 

The original TinTin animated series featuring the classic adventures of the globetrotting 
young journalist, TinTin, and his dog, Snowy. 
 

10.00  Buddy Fight (Ep 17 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Trading card based Japanese anime series. Children form a contract with creatures, also 
known as their buddy, and fight as a tag team combination. 

 

10.30  Cardfight Vanguard (Sr 3 / Ep 33 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Exciting 3rd season of Cardfight Vanguard. 
 

11.00  Little Battlers eXperience (Sr 2 / Ep 26 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

This is the story about two main heroes who love LBX and defend the world from tyranny 
with nothing but their LBX! 

 

11.30  Jackie Chan Adventures (Season 3 / Ep 15 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
Jackie Chan teams up in this anime-style animated adventure with his 11-year-old niece, Jade, 

traveling the globe to locate a dozen magical talismans before the sinister Dark Hand does. 

 
12.00NN Robotboy (Season 2 / Eps 15 - 16 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Created by world-renowned scientist Professor Moshimo, Robotboy attracts the diabolical 
attention of supervillains intent on harnessing Robotboy's powers to enslave the world. So 
Moshimo sends Robotboy far away to live with his number one fan, Tommy. 

 
 

12.30PM Geronimo Stilton (Ep 8 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
Geronimo Stilton is an exciting animated adventure-comedy series that follows the adventures of 
the famous - Geronimo Stilton – erudite mouse, head of a veritable media empire and klutz 
extraordinaire and Benjamin Stilton his fearless and smart 12 year old nephew.   

 

1.00  The Ugly Duckling & Me (Ep 3 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 
We are all familiar with Hans Christian Andersen's tale of the ugly duckling who became a swan. 
But what a lot of people don't know is that, along the way, the same duckling was adopted by 
Ratso, a city rat hiding out in a duckyard full of farm animals! 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
okto SUNDAY 25 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM The Adventures Of Paddington Bear (Ep 20 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Follow the adventures of the well-loved classic bear. 
 

2.00 Dirt Girl World (Eps 25 - 26 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Uniquely animated series with an environmental focus, e.g. exploring recycling and 
growing your own vegetables. 

 
3.00  oktOriginal: My Classmate Dad (Sr 2 / Eps 5 – 6 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R)  

(电视剧) 
This season brings about a body switch adventure with a whole new twist!  Uncle Adyson and 
nephew Chee Meng are still stuck in each other’s body as a result of a literally electrifying and 
mysterious pendant, and the hunt continues for an end to their unfortunate plight. 

 

4.00  oktOriginal: Team Word (Eps 3 – 4 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Scrumble, Fumble and Tumble your way in this word game show that not only tests your 
spelling abilities, but your speed, agility and teamwork skills as well!  Each week, two 
teams pit against each other using big letter tiles in three different challenges.   

 

5.00 Oscar The Balloonist (Eps 17 – 18 / Cartoon / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片)  

Join the exiting adventures of eight-year-old Oscar, who travels the world in his hot air 
balloon together with his trusted companion, Spike the Cactus!  
 

5.30 Wendy (Ep 9 / Cartoon / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 
The show charts the adventures of teenage heroine, Wendy and focuses on her equestrian 
centered life. Living on a stud-farm, complete with a riding school and stables, Wendy has become 
an accomplished rider and show jumper; her life is full of gossip, friendships and romances. 

 

6.00  Martha Speaks Part 2 (Ep 20 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

New episodes about Martha, a beloved family dog who is accidentally fed alphabet soup, 
giving her the power of speech and the chance to speak her mind to anyone to anyone 
that will listen, often with hilarious consequences!  
 

6.30 Oscar’s Oasis (Ep 24 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Hilarious 3D animated, non-dialogue series in the style of Looney Tunes. Oscar, the lonely 
desert lizard, battles the rigeurs of the desert as well as his un-neighbourly fellow 
inhabitants, from chickens to mischievous meerkats. 

 
 

7.00      Pokemon: Black & White (Season 15 / Ep 32 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

The continuing adventures of Ash Ketchum and Pikachu as they continue traveling though 
Unova with friends Cilan and Iris, to take on his remaining five gym badges. 

 

7.30  ThunderCats (Ep 16 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

THUNDERCATS presents the grand origin story of Prince Lion-O's ascension to the 
throne and those who would thwart his destiny at any cost and takes on epic dimensions 
in this sharp new telling. 

 
 



8.00  Mudpit (Ep 25 / Schoolkids / R)  
You ready to ROCK?! You ready to LAUGH?! Then you're ready for... MUDPIT! A live-
action/animated comedy series about four teens that form a virtual rock band in hopes of 
becoming real rock stars! 
 

8.30  The S.League Show (Ep 13 / Local Sports)  
All the goals and best action from another week of the S.League rolled into one show. The best 
football clubs in Singapore battle it out to be crowned S.League champions at the end of the 
season. 

 
 
 
 
 

okto SUNDAY 25 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM          Doctor Who (Sr 7 / Ep 10 / Drama) (电视剧)  

The Doctor and Clara find themselves aboard a space freighter that has taken the Tardis 
on-board as salvage. While the Doctor is ejected, Clara finds herself wandering through 
the vehicle exploring it's many - seemingly infinite - rooms. The Doctor re-enters the Tardis 
accompanied by three workers from the salvage ship and they have but 30 minutes to find 
her. 

 

10.00  FILMART: Defiance (Movie) (PG 13 - Violence) (艺 术 影 院)  

Jewish brothers in Nazi-occupied Eastern Europe escape into the Belarussian forests, 
where they join Russian resistance fighters and endeavor to build a village in order to 
protect themselves and about 1,000 Jewish non-combatants.  Starring Daniel Craig, Liev 
Schreiber, Jamie Bell and Alexa Davalos 
 

12.30AM         Close  
 
 
 
 

MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
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okto MONDAY 26 MAY 2014 
 

 

9.00AM         Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 17 - 18 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

 

9.30   Ella The Elephant (Sr 1 / Ep 8 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Sweet and charming, generous and kind, Ella is one little elephant that stands out in a 
crowd. Perhaps it's her bright red hat? Or maybe it's the fact that she's so good at helping 
others. With her buddies Belinda Blue, Frankie and Lola the Monkey, laughter and 
adventure go hand in hand. 

 

 
 



10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 15 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
10.30  Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 10 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

11.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 13 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  
Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of learning 
themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as they learn to 
navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 34 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 17 / Eps 11 - 12 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an enhanced 
look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the adventures of a 
cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life lessons.  

 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 25 - 26 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get the 
answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches of outer 
space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - and the top - of 
the question. 

 

 

1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 15 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
 
 
okto MONDAY 26 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM Between The Lions (Sr 5 / Ep 10 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Between the Lions is an award-winning PBS television series designed to foster the 
literacy skills of its viewers, while playfully demonstrating the joys of reading. 

 

 

2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 13 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  
Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of learning 
themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as they learn to 
navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday challenges that arise. 

 

 



2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 34 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Zero Hero (Eps 5 - 6 / Local Drama / R) (电视剧)  

Zero Hero is a series revolving around a Singaporean superhero family, The Magnificent 
Heroes, who have mysteriously lost all their super powers and now struggle to be like the 
average human being. Every week, a super villain from their past resurfaces, and it’s up to 
our superheroes with no super powers to foil them. 

 
4.00  oktOriginal: The Mad Science Manual (Eps 15 - 16 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R)  

(益智节目) 

Science is mad…fun! Or at least it is when you know how. A series of sixteen episodes 
that inspire home made scientific experiments that send the imagination racing, all the 
while encouraging kids - and the occasional adult - to ask 'WHY?'  

 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 37 - 38 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 
The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they travel 
around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is BYRD a 
handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" floating through time 
and space. 

 
5.30  Secret Kid Venture Club (Ep 6 / Schoolkids)  

The Secret KidVenture Club empowers kids by helping them understand the world they 
live in, teaching them about the impact their decisions have on their own liveseven when 
they are 8 years old! Its not about understanding a Balance Sheet but rather about the 
value of ones reputation. 

 

6.00  oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 8 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

The Primary 3 prefects use their magical abilities to help a friend in need. They finally 
come to terms with their special powers in a mostly human world. Little do they know that 
all along, another magical being has been watching them! 

 

6.30     okto @ The Movies: Open Season 3 (Movie / Schoolkids)  
After the events of Open Season 2, Boog plans an annual hunting trip for his 
woodland buddies but they choose family obligations which made Boog take a trip 
on his own leading him to a circus. 
 

8.30 Tricky TV (Sr 3 / Ep 20 / Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

In this season, host & magician Stephen Mulhern returns with a talented cast of young 
trickers to boogle the brains of the viewing public with amazing magic and stunts. 
 

 
 
okto MONDAY 26 MAY 2014 
 
9.00PM           ANIMAL NIGHT: Built For The Kill: Great White Sharks (Season 4 / Ep 3 / Info-ed)  

(With Chinese Subtitles) (益智节目)  

This episode follows the epic migration of a pregnant female Great White Shark from 
Australia to South Africa, revealing real life-and-death struggles in dramatic detail. 

 



10.00  a-ok: Antiques Road Trip (Sr 7 / Ep 7 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Antiques experts Anita Manning and James Lewis begin in the London district of 
Wimbledon, before travelling through Molesey and then heading for their auction near the 
town of Alresford. The items they buy in this episode include a silver and crystal ashtray, 
an 18th-century Chinese blue-and-white vase, and a mid-20th century tennis racket. 
 

11.00   a-ok: Arts.21 (Ep 143 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Arts.21 examines the latest trend in Cannes - the rise of the biopic. Why are film directors 
mining real life for their art? It also takes a look at a compelling photo series about what 
soldiers see when they’re learning to take aim, and pays a visit to the restored Bauhaus 
ensemble in Dessau.  
 

11.30   a-ok: Euromaxx (Ep 143 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

Topics include changes in office fashion, the Sissinghurst Castle garden in southeastern 
England, and the Italian island of Elba in the Mediterranean. 

 
12.00MN         Close 
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okto TUESDAY 27 MAY 2014 
 

9.00AM           Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 19 - 20 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

 

9.30   Ella The Elephant (Sr 1 / Ep 9 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Sweet and charming, generous and kind, Ella is one little elephant that stands out in a 
crowd. Perhaps it's her bright red hat? Or maybe it's the fact that she's so good at helping 
others. With her buddies Belinda Blue, Frankie and Lola the Monkey, laughter and 
adventure go hand in hand. 

 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 16 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every episode, 
our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a mission with a 
specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic ROCKET, and together 
they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 

10.30  Poppets Town (Ep 1 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Cheerful & colorful animated preschool series, based on the characters in a Japanese 
story book. 

 

11.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 14 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  
Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of learning 
themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as they learn to 
navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 35 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 17 / Eps 13 - 14 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 
 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 27 - 28 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get 
the answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches 
of outer space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - 
and the top - of the question. 

 

1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 16 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 
This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every episode, 
our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a mission with a 
specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic ROCKET, and together 
they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
 
 



 
 
 

okto TUESDAY 27 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM Poppets Town (Ep 1 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Cheerful & colorful animated preschool series, based on the characters in a Japanese 
story book. 

 
2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 14 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 
2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 35 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
3.00 oktOriginal: oktOriginal: My Classmate Dad (Sr 2 / Eps 7 – 8 / Local Drama / Schoolkids 

/ R) (电视剧) 

This season brings about a body switch adventure with a whole new twist!  Uncle Adyson 
and nephew Chee Meng are still stuck in each other’s body as a result of a literally 
electrifying and mysterious pendant, and the hunt continues for an end to their unfortunate 
plight. 
 

4.00  oktOriginal: Team Word (Eps 5 – 6 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Scrumble, Fumble and Tumble your way in this word game show that not only tests your 
spelling abilities, but your speed, agility and teamwork skills as well!  Each week, two 
teams pit against each other using big letter tiles in three different challenges.   

 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 39 - 40 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 
5.30  Secret Kid Venture Club (Ep 7 / Schoolkids)  

The Secret KidVenture Club empowers kids by helping them understand the world they 
live in, teaching them about the impact their decisions have on their own liveseven when 
they are 8 years old! Its not about understanding a Balance Sheet but rather about the 
value of ones reputation. 

 

6.00 oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 8 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)  

With the help of Killah Litta-man, Nikki shows us the danger of running with scissors. Aiken 
sits way too close to the TV and suffers the worse for it. Mr Know It All plays on an 
escalator and is squished.  
 

6.30            SpongeBob SquarePants (Ep 143 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

For the world's favourite sea sponge, SpongeBob, his best friend Patrick, and the other 
residents of the tropical Bikini Bottom, life is a series of nautical and often nonsensical 
adventures. 

 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

okto TUESDAY 27 MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM Scooby-Doo! Mystery Incorporated (Season 1 / Ep 10 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

A sleepy little village, Crystal Cove boasts a long history of ghost sightings, poltergeists, 
demon possessions, phantoms and other paranormal occurrences. The renowned 
sleuthing team of Fred, Daphne, Velma, Shaggy and Scooby-Doo prove all of this simply 
isn't real, and along the way, uncover a larger, season-long mystery that will change 
everything. 

 

7.30  Totally Spies (Sr 6 / Ep 16 / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 

The girls are back to fight more crime for WHOOP! Follow their ongoing journey in the 
exciting and dangerous world of international espionage, all whilst juggling school and 
their studies! 

 
8.00  Just Kidding (Ep 25 / Schoolkids) 

Just Kidding is a prank show hosted by Zach Fox. 
 

8.30  Lab Rats Challenge (Sr 2 / Ep 7 / Schoolkids / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

In every show two teams made up of pairs of friends compete in a range of science based 
challenges. Each team is assigned a host who commentate on what is happening and how 
it works. They talk to team members about their tactics, progress and feelings.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
okto TUESDAY 27 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM          DOCUMENTARY: Food Factory 3 (Eps 15 - 16 / Info-ed) (益智节目) 

From raw materials to finished products, Food Factory goes behind the scenes to reveal 
how some American favourite foods are made. 
 

10.00 a-ok: KNOCKOUT (Sr 7 / Ep 9 / Local Info-ed) (益智节目)  

This week, get intricate with rice grain painting, get schooled with school events, get 
creatively informed on the 5, get twirling under my umbrella and get grooving to the 
intense K-Pop dance challenge. Only on KNOCKOUT: CARNIVAL! 
   

10.30 a-ok: ARTreprenuers (Ep 3 / Local Info-ed / 2nd Telecast) (益智节目)  

“ARTreprenuers is a series that explores the world of art and creative endeavors from the 
one thing all Singaporeans understand best: the economy.  Each episode will feature a 
particular segment of Singapore’s diverse field of arts and creative startups, with a unique 
and sustainable revenue model that hold its own against other brick and mortar 
businesses. 
 

11.00  a-ok: Ade In Britain (Sr 2 / Ep 28 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

Adrian Edmondson is off to England’s northernmost county, Northumberland, to search for 
local British foods and traditions.   

 
12.00MN         Close 
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9.00AM           Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 21 - 22 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

 

9.30   Ella The Elephant (Sr 1 / Ep 10 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Sweet and charming, generous and kind, Ella is one little elephant that stands out in a 
crowd. Perhaps it's her bright red hat? Or maybe it's the fact that she's so good at helping 
others. With her buddies Belinda Blue, Frankie and Lola the Monkey, laughter and 
adventure go hand in hand. 

 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 17 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
10.30  Poppets Town (Ep 2 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Cheerful & colorful animated preschool series, based on the characters in a Japanese 
story book. 

 
11.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 15 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 36 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 17 / Eps 15 - 16 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 

 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 29 - 30 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get 
the answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches 
of outer space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - 
and the top - of the question. 

 
 
 
 
 



 

1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 17 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
 
 
 

okto  WEDNESDAY 28  MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM Poppets Town (Ep 2 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Cheerful & colorful animated preschool series, based on the characters in a Japanese 
story book. 

 
2.00   Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 15 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 36 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 
3.00 oktOriginal: R.E.M. – The Next Generation (Sr 2 / Eps 4 – 5 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / 

R) (电视剧) 

Picking up where the first season left off, the sensational second season sees the terrific 
trio of Roxy, Elle and M. diving into the heat of the action!  The question of what happened 
to Roxy's sister Rachel and the original REM is answered while new mysteries unfold. 

 

4.00  oktOriginal: Street Racers (Eps 7 - 8 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Get ready for some high-octane action as we speed through our heritage trails on Street 
Racers! Each week, our guides pair up with 2 contestants each for a Street Racers 
Challenge.  The first team to finish the race will become our Street Racers Champion! 
Willthey have the drive to finish the race? Who will emerge the winner? 
 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 41 - 42 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 
5.30  Secret Kid Venture Club (Ep 8 / Schoolkids)  

The Secret KidVenture Club empowers kids by helping them understand the world they 
live in, teaching them about the impact their decisions have on their own liveseven when 
they are 8 years old! Its not about understanding a Balance Sheet but rather about the 
value of ones reputation. 

 

6.00  Spectacular Spoder-Man (Ep 1 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

When a spider bite transforms him into Spectacular Spider-Man, Peter Parker's newfound 
superhero status places him at odds with a rogues' gallery of super-villains. 
 



6.30          SpongeBob SquarePants (Ep 144 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

For the world's favourite sea sponge, SpongeBob, his best friend Patrick, and the other 
residents of the tropical Bikini Bottom, life is a series of nautical and often nonsensical 
adventures. 

 
 
 
 
 

okto  WEDNESDAY 28  MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM Scooby-Doo! Mystery Incorporated (Season 1 / Ep 11 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

A sleepy little village, Crystal Cove boasts a long history of ghost sightings, poltergeists, 
demon possessions, phantoms and other paranormal occurrences. The renowned 
sleuthing team of Fred, Daphne, Velma, Shaggy and Scooby-Doo prove all of this simply 
isn't real, and along the way, uncover a larger, season-long mystery that will change 
everything. 

 

7.30   Totally Spies (Sr 6 / Ep 17 / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 

The girls are back to fight more crime for WHOOP! Follow their ongoing journey in the 
exciting and dangerous world of international espionage, all whilst juggling school and 
their studies! 

 
8.00  Crash & Bernstein (Yr 1 / Ep 8 / Schoolkids) (PG)  

When Wyatt's intramural basketball coach quits due to Crash's relentless heckling, Crash 
steps in as the new coach in hopes of breaking their losing streak. But after he benches 
Wyatt and hires an NBA player, Crash learns that winning isn't always everything. 
Meanwhile, Cleo agrees to supply Wyatt's team with basketball jerseys and hires Amanda 
to work for her fashion company. 

 

8.30  Kitchen Whiz (Sr 4 / Ep 8 / Info-ed / Schoolkids) (益智节目)   

Kitchen Whiz is a fast, fabulous, food focussed game show for kids. A 4-course menu of 
messy, hands on quick cooking and food competition, keeps contestants on their toes as 
they race around the super stocked Kitchn Whiz Pantry. 2 teams of junior chefs compete 
in fun, messy and tactile tasks. 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
okto WEDNESDAY 28 MAY 2014 
 
9.00PM     ANIMAL NIGHT: Caught In The Act  (Season 4 / Ep 3 / Info-ed) (With Chinese Subtitles)  

(益智节目)  

This documentary showcases some of wildlife's most remarkable moments, including the 
birth of an elephant, a domestic cat’s daring confrontation with an alligator, a ferocious 
fight between two tigers, a manta ray’s encounter with a diver, and a crocodile’s attack on 
a buffalo. 
 

10.00   a-ok: City In A Garden (Ep 2 / Local Info-ed) (益智节目)  

This series will feature four core stories of real people revisiting the past, living their 
present, and envisioning their future. Their rich life experiences, connected in one way or 
another with the Singapore Botanic Gardens, have not only impacted their lives, changed 
their surroundings, but also touched those around them. 

 

10.30   a-ok: My Roots (Ep 2 / Local Info-ed / 2nd Telecast) (益智节目)  

My Roots is a documentary series that intrigues and inspires us to learn more about who 
we are through our genealogy. In each episode, a well-known Singaporean goes on a 
personal journey of self-discovery and surprises, to trace his or her ancestry.   
 

11.00  a-ok: Takeshi Art Beat (Eps 10 - 11 / Info-ed / 2nd Telecast) (益智节目)  

Takeshi Kitano visits Genbei Yamaguchi, the 10th generation wholesaler of ‘obi’, the name 
given to the sashes for kimono and other traditional Japanese attire. He visits Mitsuo 
Ogawa, an expert traditional temple carpenter in Japan. At Ogawa's workshop, Takeshi is 
thrilled to observe the carpentry skills used to create Japan's distinctive religious 
architecture. 

 
12.00MN         Close 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 



MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
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okto  THURSDAY 29 MAY 2014 
 
 

9.00AM           Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 23 – 24 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

 

9.30   Ella The Elephant (Sr 1 / Ep 11 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Sweet and charming, generous and kind, Ella is one little elephant that stands out in a 
crowd. Perhaps it's her bright red hat? Or maybe it's the fact that she's so good at helping 
others. With her buddies Belinda Blue, Frankie and Lola the Monkey, laughter and 
adventure go hand in hand. 

 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 18 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 

10.30  Poppets Town (Ep 3 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Cheerful & colorful animated preschool series, based on the characters in a Japanese 
story book. 

 
11.00   Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 16 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 37 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 17 / Eps 17 - 18 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 

 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 31 - 32 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get the 
answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches of outer 
space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - and the top - of 
the question. 

 

1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 18 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 



 
 
 
 
 

okto  THURSDAY 29 MAY 2014 
 

1.30PM Poppets Town (Ep 3 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Cheerful & colorful animated preschool series, based on the characters in a Japanese 
story book. 

 

2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 16 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 37 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Dream School (Eps 9 – 10 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 

A group of kids enrol into a school for the performing arts. This musical drama series is 
about their trials and tribulations as they try to fit into a creative environment to nurture 
their special gifts.  
 

4.00  oktOriginal: Brain Juice (Eps 1 – 2 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Brain Juice is a roving Quiz Game Show that goes from school to school each week to 
settle once and for all, who are the brainiest bunch of kids in school. It is the platform that 
will give the brainiacs in school a chance to shine!  

 

5.00 Flying With Byrd (Eps 43 - 44 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

The series features a cast of ethnically diverse characters who have adventures as they 
travel around the world - as well as through time and space. Their mentor and guide is 
BYRD a handsome, international pop star who is on a quest to find all the "lost notes" 
floating through time and space. 

 
5.30  Secret Kid Venture Club (Ep 9 / Schoolkids)  

The Secret KidVenture Club empowers kids by helping them understand the world they 
live in, teaching them about the impact their decisions have on their own liveseven when 
they are 8 years old! Its not about understanding a Balance Sheet but rather about the 
value of ones reputation. 

 

6.00  Planet Sheen (Season 1 / Ep 9 / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片) 

After sneaking into his best friend Jimmy Neutron's laboratory, Sheen accidentally blasts 
himself into outer space in Jimmy's top-secret rocketship! Sheen crash-lands on Planet 
Zeenu and ends up having crazy adventures with the Zeenuians while trying to survive the 
evil plots of Dorkus. 

 

6.30       Phineas & Ferb (Yr 3 / Ep 28 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

Step-brothers PHINEAS and FERB, aspire to make every day of their summer vacation 
spectacular by devising imaginative creations. 
 

 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

okto  THURSDAY 29 MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM Scooby-Doo! Mystery Incorporated (Season 1 / Ep 12 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

A sleepy little village, Crystal Cove boasts a long history of ghost sightings, poltergeists, 
demon possessions, phantoms and other paranormal occurrences. The renowned 
sleuthing team of Fred, Daphne, Velma, Shaggy and Scooby-Doo prove all of this simply 
isn't real, and along the way, uncover a larger, season-long mystery that will change 
everything. 
 

7.30  Dude, That‘s My Ghost! (Eps 39 – 40 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Dude, That’s My Ghost! follows the adventures of 14-year-old Spencer when he moves to 
Hollywood with  his family and has to adjust to life with his new buddy, the ghost of uber-
famous pop star, Billy Joe Cobra.  
 

8.00  oktOriginal: Wizards Of Honey Street (Ep 8 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

The Primary 3 prefects use their magical abilities to help a friend in need. They finally 
come to terms with their special powers in a mostly human world. Little do they know that 
all along, another magical being has been watching them! 
 

8.30  oktOriginal: Don‘t Try This At Home (Ep 8 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

With the help of Killah Litta-man, Nikki shows us the danger of running with scissors. Aiken 
sits way too close to the TV and suffers the worse for it. Mr Know It All plays on an 
escalator and is squished.  

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

okto THURSDAY 29 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM           DOCUMENTARY: Seconds From Diaster: 9/11 (Sr 4 / Ep 2 / Info-ed) (益智节目) (PG) 

This episode examines the terrorist attacks of September 11, 2001, featuring testimony 
from air traffic control staff, and asking whether anyone could have stopped the 
perpetrators. 
 

10.00  a-ok: Island Feast With Peter Kuruvita (Ep 9 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

This series takes Australian chef Peter Kuruvita into some of the world’s most fascinating 
island communities, where he discovers the vibrant intricacies of island life and the 
tradition, passion and flair behind local cuisines. 
 

10.30  a-ok: Luke Nguyen’s Greater Mekong Part 1 (Ep 9 / Info-ed) (益智节目)   

Luke arrives at mountainous Mae Salong, where he prepares a rustic tomato dish with 
Apear, an Aka grandmother. 
 

11.00   a-ok: Treasures Of Ancient Egypt (Ep 2 / Info-ed) (益智节目)    

On a journey through ancient Egyptian art, Alastair Sooke picks treasures from its most 
opulent and glittering moment. Starting with troubling psychological portraits of tyrant king 
Senwosret III and ending with the golden mask of boy king Tutankhamun, Sooke also 
explores architectural wonders, exquisite tombs and a lost city - site of the greatest artistic 
revolution in Egypt's history. 

 
12.00MN         Close 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

MediaCorp Pte Ltd 
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okto  FRIDAY 30 MAY 2014 
 
 

9.00AM          Guess How Much I Love You (Eps 25 - 26 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Gentle, charming preschool series based on the best-selling picture book written by Sam 
McBratney and illustrated by Anita Jeram. 

 
9.30   Ella The Elephant (Sr 1 / Ep 12 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Sweet and charming, generous and kind, Ella is one little elephant that stands out in a 
crowd. Perhaps it's her bright red hat? Or maybe it's the fact that she's so good at helping 
others. With her buddies Belinda Blue, Frankie and Lola the Monkey, laughter and 
adventure go hand in hand. 

 

10.00   Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 19 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 

 
10.30  Poppets Town (Ep 4 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Cheerful & colorful animated preschool series, based on the characters in a Japanese 
story book. 

 

11.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 17 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

11.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 38 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

12.00NN   Thomas & Friends (Sr 17 / Eps 19 - 20 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 

The ever-popular children's series returns for a new run of railway adventures with an 
enhanced look. Thomas & Friends invites children into a world of imagination where the 
adventures of a cheeky little tank engine and his trusty friends reflect all manner of life 
lessons. 

 

12.30PM         Doki (Eps 33 - 34 / Preschool) (幼儿乐园) 
The inquisitive DOKI has a lot of questions - and he will go anywhere on the planet to get the 
answers! Any From China to Brazil and from the bottom of the sea to the far reaches of outer 
space, DOKI and his friends set out on far flung adventures to get to the bottom - and the top - of 
the question. 

 
 
 
 
 



1.00  Little Einsteins (Yr 2 / Ep 19 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

This series provides preschoolers with new ways to hear and see music and art. In every 
episode, our four heroes meet at their backyard clubhouse and, before long, embark on a 
mission with a specific goal to reach. The heroes enlist their amazing friend, the dynamic 
ROCKET, and together they blast off on "the mission of the day". 
 

 

okto  FRIDAY 30 MAY 2014 
 
1.30PM Poppets Town (Ep 4 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Cheerful & colorful animated preschool series, based on the characters in a Japanese 
story book. 

 
2.00  Henry Hugglemonster (Yr 1 / Ep 17 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

Henry Hugglemonster models positive life lessons that young viewers are in the process of 
learning themselves. Henry showcases many of the emotions that young children feel as 
they learn to navigate their own lives, along with an added dose of humor to the everyday 
challenges that arise. 

 

2.30  William & Sparkle‘s Magical Tales (Ep 38 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

Come into the enchanted world of William the Wizard and Sparkles the Fairy, two playful 
characters that use their magical talents to have fun, solve problems, help out their visiting 
friends, and sometimes create mischief! 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Nick Of Time (Eps 9 - 10 / Local Drama / Schoolkids / R) (电视剧) 

A fun adventure drama series, Nick of Time is about improving our way of life, conserving 
nature and how we all have a part to play to make a better future for everyone. 

 
4.00 oktOriginal: World Class (Eps 3 - 4 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

“World Class” is a documentary, part drama where students from all over the world get to 
see, learn and experience about each other’s culture and background in a light-hearted 
and fun way!  

 
5.00 oktOriginal: Can You Make Sense Of This? (Ep 1 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R)  

(益智节目) 

“Can You Make Sense of This?” is an educational family game show that puts two teams 
against each other. Each week, they need to overcome a series of obstacle challenges, 
solve puzzles and quiz that will put all their 5 senses to the ultimate test.   

 

5.30  Super Yoyo (Ep 9 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Shunichi Domoto is a talented sportie 5th grade boy who used to help sport teams in his 
school. He enters a Yoyo duel against a bully boy called Benkei to help his friend, Beso, to 
get back his Yoyo and won the yoyo battle. However, he meets the exceptionally gifted 
Yoyo-er, Seito Hojoin who beat him because he ridiculed Yoyo game .So, Shunichi enters 
the Japan`s Yoyo championship to get his revenge with Seito.  

 

6.00  oktOriginal: KNOCKOUT (Sr 7 / Ep 9 / Local Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

This week, get intricate with rice grain painting, get schooled with school events, get 
creatively informed on the 5, get twirling under my umbrella and get grooving to the 
intense K-Pop dance challenge. Only on KNOCKOUT: CARNIVAL! 

 

6.30      Phineas & Ferb (Yr 3 / Ep 29 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片)  

Step-brothers PHINEAS and FERB, aspire to make every day of their summer vacation 
spectacular by devising imaginative creations. 

 



7.00  Ooglies (Ep 10 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

A quirky and wacky series of shorts featuring vegetables and household objects brought to 
stop-motion, animated life! 

  

7.15   Great Eastern YEO’s S.League 2014: RHB Singapore Cup Preliminaries (Sports / 
Local / LIVE)  

 
 
 
 
okto  FRIDAY 30 MAY 2014 
 
9.30PM          ANIMAL NIGHT: Nature’s Microworlds (Ep 14 / Info-ed) (With Chinese Subtitles)  

(益智节目)  

Nature’s Microworlds takes viewers on a fascinating journey, offering a definitive guide to 
some very special places on Earth. 

 

10.00 a-ok: Murdoch Mysteries (Sr 5 / Ep 2 / Drama) (电视剧)  

Detective Murdoch investigates the murder of an Alderman, killed during the attempted 
assassination of the city’s mayor. 

 

10.00 a-ok: Ben Hur (Part 2 / Drama) (电视剧)  

Judah saves the life of the Roman admiral Quintus Arrius during their encounter with a 
fleet of Macedonian pirates.  Arrius successfully petitions Emperor Tiberius to free Ben-
Hur and adopts him as his son. After Arrius’ death, Judah returns to Jerusalem in the 
hopes of finding his mother Miriam and sister Tirzah, who were also imprisoned, and to 
seek revenge against his one-time friend Messala. 

 
12.00MN        Close 
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okto  SATURDAY 31 MAY 2014 
 

 

7.00AM           oktOriginal: Zoom, Zim, Zam (Eps 17 - 18 / Local Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园)  

“Zoom Zim Zam” is a, phonics based educational pre-school series.  The series features 
Zoomba, Zimba and Zamba literacy superheroes. Who together with their friends learn 
about the world around them and the sounds that alphabets make. The series will feature 
original songs and Dance as part of the programme. 
 

8.00           Sesame Street (Season 40 / Ep 4 / Preschool / R) (幼儿乐园) 

The beloved Sesame Street gang return in a refreshed show format, complete with new 
guest stars, and a brand new opening theme song! 

 

9.00  My Little Pony: Friendship Is Magic (Season 2 / Ep 17 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片)  

More magical adventures in Equestria and Ponyville, with Twilight Sparkle and her best 
pony gal friends not forgetting Spike, of course! 
 

9.30  Winx Club (Sr 4 / Ep 4 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片)  

This season delivers an enthralling and intense story plot but with a stronger dose of 
comedy than previously.  At Alphea college the new school year is about to begin, 
however the pleasant atmosphere is ruined by the Fairy Hunters who attack the school 
and defeat the Winx.  The Winx decide to go to Earth to Save the Last Fairy. 
 

10.00  Pokemon: BW Adventures In Unova And Beyond (Sr 16 / Ep 22 / Schoolkids / Cartoon)  

(卡通片)  

As Team Plasma’s mission to control Pokémon continues, Team Rocket’s mission takes 
aim at Team Plasma! 
 

10.30  Planet Sheen (Season 1 / Ep 10 / Schoolkids / R) (卡通片) 

After sneaking into his best friend Jimmy Neutron's laboratory, Sheen accidentally blasts 
himself into outer space in Jimmy's top-secret rocketship! Sheen crash-lands on Planet 
Zeenu and ends up having crazy adventures with the Zeenuians while trying to survive the 
evil plots of Dorkus. 

 

11.00  Little Battlers eXperience (Sr 2 / Ep 27 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

This is the story about two main heroes who love LBX and defend the world from tyranny 
with nothing but their LBX! 
 

11.30  Power Rangers Mega Force (Ep 10 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

Five teenagers with talent and attitude to form the ultimate team...the Power Rangers 
Megaforce! Using their new found special abilities, mega-weapons, high-tech Zords and 
giant Megazords to battle this new alien threat. 
 

12.00NN oktOriginal: Once Upon A Hero (Telemovie / Local / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目)   

It's been one year since The Magnificent Heroes saved Singapore from Captain 
Chaoszzz’s evil regime. But things are about to change with the appearance of a new, evil 
and powerful villain, Doomsday Clock. Will our Magnificent Heroes stand their ground to 
reveal Doomsday Clock's true identity and masterplan, or will they flee leaving evil to reign 
supreme?   



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

okto  SATURDAY 31 MAY 2014 
 
1.00PM Adventurers Masters Of Time (Eps 17 - 18 / Schoolkids / R)  

Four school friends are suddenly whisked back through the ages on a desperate search 
for their missing computer professor - by uploading themselves by way of a time 
continuum software! Unfortunately they haven't made the journey alone. An evil hacker is 
threatening to change world history. 

 
2.00  Kaijudo (Eps 15 - 16 / Schoolkids / R)  

Ray, a 14-year-old who lives with his mom and granddad, has been recruited by the Duel 
Masters to study Kaijudo: The Way of the Creature. They chose Ray for his natural talent 
as a creature tamer and duelist. 

 

3.00  oktOriginal: Zero Hero (Eps 5 - 6 / Local Drama / R) (电视剧)  

Zero Hero is a series revolving around a Singaporean superhero family, The Magnificent 
Heroes, who have mysteriously lost all their super powers and now struggle to be like the 
average human being. Every week, a super villain from their past resurfaces, and it’s up to 
our superheroes with no super powers to foil them. 

 
4.00  oktOriginal: The Mad Science Manual (Eps 15 - 16 / Local Info-ed / Schoolkids / R)  

(益智节目) 

Science is mad…fun! Or at least it is when you know how. A series of sixteen episodes 
that inspire home made scientific experiments that send the imagination racing, all the 
while encouraging kids - and the occasional adult - to ask 'WHY?'  

 
5.00  Magic Planet (Eps 1 – 2 / Schoolkids / Info-ed / R) (益智节目) 

Educational, animated series where grandpa Arthemus brings his grandchildren around 
the world in his magic machine to learn about animals. 

   

5.30 Wendy (Ep 10 / Cartoon / Schoolkids) (卡通片) 

The show charts the adventures of teenage heroine, Wendy and focuses on her equestrian 
centered life. Living on a stud-farm, complete with a riding school and stables, Wendy has 
become an accomplished rider and show jumper; her life is full of gossip, friendships and 
romances. 

   

6.00  Martha Speaks Part 2 (Ep 21 / Schoolkids / Cartoon) (卡通片) 

New episodes about Martha, a beloved family dog who is accidentally fed alphabet soup, 
giving her the power of speech and the chance to speak her mind to anyone to anyone 
that will listen, often with hilarious consequences!  

 

6.30  Oscar’s Oasis (Ep 25 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

Hilarious 3D animated, non-dialogue series in the style of Looney Tunes. Oscar, the lonely 
desert lizard, battles the rigeurs of the desert as well as his un-neighbourly fellow 
inhabitants, from chickens to mischievous meerkats. 

 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

okto  SATURDAY 31 MAY 2014 
 

7.00PM     Pokemon: Black & White (Season 15 / Ep 33 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

The continuing adventures of Ash Ketchum and Pikachu as they continue traveling though 
Unova with friends Cilan and Iris, to take on his remaining five gym badges. 

 

7.30  ThunderCats (Ep 17 / Schoolkids / Cartoon / R) (卡通片) 

THUNDERCATS presents the grand origin story of Prince Lion-O's ascension to the 
throne and those who would thwart his destiny at any cost and takes on epic dimensions 
in this sharp new telling. 
 

8.00  Mudpit (Ep 26 / Schoolkids / R)  
You ready to ROCK?! You ready to LAUGH?! Then you're ready for... MUDPIT! A live-
action/animated comedy series about four teens that form a virtual rock band in hopes of 
becoming real rock stars! 

 

8.30  Fort Boyard Ultimate Challenge (Srs 1 & 2 / Ep 6 / Info-ed / Schoolkids / R) (益智节目) 

Fort Boyard - Ultimate Challenge is the ultimate adventure series where 24 teens from the 
United States and the United Kingdom compete as teams in a series of exciting 
challenges designed to test their brainpower, courage and teamwork! 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

okto  SATURDAY 31 MAY 2014 
 

9.00PM oktoLIFE: Animal's World II (Ep 2 / Info-ed) (益智节目)  

This documentary series brings an extraordinary new perspective to the enduring 
fascination of some of nature's most intriguing creatures. Lions, elephants and 
chimpanzees are featured in the show's second season, as intimate portraits help viewers 
understand how these members of the animal kingdom perceive their world. 

 
10.00  CENTRESTAGE: Mahlermania: Nico And The Navigators (Culture)  

This is a ‘dramatic fantasy with music by Gustav Mahler’ conceived by the troupe Nico and 
the Navigators.  A progressive outlook versus fear of the unknown, the bitterness of the 
outsider versus a yearning for greener grass, a manic drive versus self-absorption. Gustav 
Mahler's music is a mass of contrasts and dualities linked only by a weak tissue of shifting 
balances. 

 
12.00MN       Close 
  
 


